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"Do you know who that guy 
is?" No, but it doesn't matter. 
He's in the PEP Party." "Yeah, 
I guess I'll vote for him." 
"Have you voted?" "No, what 
for?" "PEP will get everything, 
Independents don't have a 
chance. " 

"Hey, did you hear about the 
pep rally tonight?" "Yeah, but 
I'm not going." "Why not?" 
"Oh, I've got better things to 
do." "Like what?" ''I'm not 
sure yet, but something will 
come up." 

Practice, practice, in rain, 
heat or pain the band faithfully 
practices and drills. They con­
stantly dream up new routines, 
march on wet fields and play 
.. J alisco" to boost spirit and 
support the Hogs. Little reward 
is given to the band except a 
sizeable applause after their 
half time performance. 
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Rto 
PERMITS 

Huffing and puffing you walk 
into class just in the nick of 
time. You take your back pack 
off and vow that Lomorrow you 
will leave the apartment five 
minutes to eight instead of three 
minutes. Yeah, riding your bike 
to school sure saves a lot of time 
and you don't have to worry 
about finding a parking place or 
paying for a parking sticker. Of 
course, you do have to watch 
out for the motorist who is also 
running late, and if your bike 
will still be waiting for you 
when you get out of class. 

The bookstore und e rwe nt 
changes this year, much to the 
students dissatisfaction . Now, 
instead of the old self -se rvice 
way of selling boo:,s, the book­
store launched a new system 
whereby employees behind a 
counter at the rear of the store 
ask students for a list of the 
books needed and they, often 
aimlessly and desperately, hunt 
for them. This met with much 
bickering, since the student was 
unable to examine a book or 
find out how much a book cost 
until actually purchasing the 
book. This also meant goodbye 
to browsing around and looking 
for the best used book. The new 
system also create d another 
problem - it made another long 
line to wait in. 

It's not easy being a bad guy. 
But virtually this is what the 
campus cops have been labeled 
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by students. This fall they have 
enforced a new policy which 
allows students only 20 minutes 
of parking in front of College 
Hall. Of course, we all know 
this is ridiculous since it takes 
at least that long to see any of 
the big honchos. Regardless, 
sunstroke or not, the dedicated 
campus cops stand under trees in 
front of College Hall mechani­
call y checking their watches, 
making sure there are no park­
ing violations. 

A cheerleader is a person with 
a bright smile, a dynamic per­
sonality, and a friend to every­
one. These are a few traits 
which enable her to motivate 
the crowd to back up their 
team. Her enthusiasm in par­
ticipating in pep rallies and at 
football games, shows her out­
standing spirit. Rain or shine, 
win or lose, she still carries that 
cenain smile. 

"Oh dad, don't embarrass 
me, " is a common reaction to 
good old Dad ' s Day. Parents 
from all over come down to 
visit the A&I campus and see 
their '·babies." Moms are seen 

Ihauling loads of plants from the 
Ag building to the trunk of the 
car. Dads are seen opening 
checkbooks and wallets to help 
supplement their son's or 
daughter'S expenses. After a 
day of being glued to your par­
ents, it·s finally time to sepa­
rate. Parents are off to one side 
of the football stadium for the 
game, and students head for the 
other side. 
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Dorm life is another tragedy 
A&I students face. Students are 
forced to live with another per­
son in small off white colored 
cubicles about half the size of 
their rooms at home. Adjust­
ments also have to be made to 
the other residents on the hall. 
Many of them don't agree that 
sleep is a human necessity. 
Yet, you're stuck and have to 
make the best of it. The smells 
of a dorm are unique. The air is 
filled with a variety of fra­
grances from the aroma of 
freshly popped pop-corn, disin­
fectant, burned food, incense, 
to the smell of garbage. 

Eating contests are a chal­
lenge for all dorm residents . 
One of the most popular contests 
is probably the pancake eating 
contest. Both guys and girls lit­
erally "stuff their faces." 
Before the event students usu­
ally fast which is easy to do 
since dorm food is usually 
known to be inedible and occa­
sionall y causes food poisoning. 
It's not unusual to discover 
something in your food. If 
you ' re lucky it has ceased mov­
ing. 

Spring elections produce 
smiling faces and colorful and 
persuasive speakers. There are 
promises, and promises. Stu­
dents usually don't know the 
people on the ballot so they cir­
cle the name that has the nicest 
ring . 

This year there were other 
important elections - the presi­
dental, state and local. Many 
A&I students attended political 
ralli es for presidential candi­
dates who visited Corpus 
Christi. 
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With the beginning of fall 
comes the traditional fall car­
nival. Students are seen hur­
ri edl y hammering boards 
together in an effort to construct 
a booth that will not collapse. 
Pledges are fully abused. They 
are dunked in water, targets of 
eggs , pies, and endless other 
things. 

The week of finals is the most 
dreaded week in the life of all 
students. We knew it was com­
ing. Yet, instead of gradually 
pre paring oursel ves, we cram 
the da y before. It's amazing 
how much we can drill into our 
minds in only one night. But, as 
long as we have coffee and food 
at our fingertips, we can gener­
ally manage to study through 
the night and into the morning. 
However, there are a few dra w­
backs: (1) we find it difficult to 

stay awake during the exam, (2) 
we gain about five pounds, and 
(3) we don't always pass the 
exam . That's when we go to our 
profs with little white lies and 
stories. 

A&I is fortunate to have a 
number of foreign students 
enrolled here. But, are the for­
eign students fortunate? Being 
stuck he re every weekend, 
Thanksgi ving, and Christmas, 
being isolated from home and 
friends, awaiting letters from 
girlfriends who hopefully still 
remember their names, are 
fates almost worse than death. 
So, they study and study. 
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"Is that all there is?" That's 
what graduating seniors ask 
after the graduating ceremonies 
at A&I. After four long years, 
sometimes less, you finally 
reach one of your goals - gradu­
ation. Yet, it's a let down. 
Instead of getting a natural high 
during the ceremonies, you feel 
like cattle parading on stage, 
grabbing a piece of paper, 
shaking hands with some big 
shot and parading out to a world 
that has few jobs available for 
you. 

Homecoming activities were 
dampened this year by heavy 
rains. Students huddled with 
friends, wrapping themsel ves 
with blankets and holding 
umbrellas, in an attempt to 
keep dry and warm. Few girls 
dressed up for the long awaited 
event; but instead wore old blue 
jeans and T-shirts. Guys had sad 
expressions on their faces as 
they saw their girlfriendss mums 
fall apart. What a waste. The 
following week several students 
were out due to illness. 

8 
The student health center -

the $6.50 student health fee 
"ripoff". It's where a full time 
doctor is supposed to be, where 
you pay a small fee for injec­
tions, dressing, and medica­
tion, and where you go when 
you're sick. Unfortunately when 
you leave you still feel sick. 
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Jerks are prevalent on the A&I 
campus. They are the un-cool 
clowns - the ones who actually 
study and don't let you copy off 
their paper; the ones who don't 
let you say your piece; and the 
ones who always butter up the 
prof. 

Kegs and drinking are a tradi­
tion at A&I. Tons of beer are 
consumed each football game 
resulting in students appearing 
to be "under the influence." 
Thus A&I students are obviously 
making beer distributors rich. 
Now if we could only get Kle­
berg County to go "wet. " 

Lectures are often much too 
long and boring. If you're lucky 
you can get a seat in the back of 
the room and cut some zzzs. 

Library: the refuge of all stu­
dents. You can always tell when 
finals are approaching. The 
sure sign is a crowded library. 
Parking is impossible during 
these trying times, so is trying 
to find that reserved book you 
need to read for the next morn­
ing's exam. Other than during 
finals the library is used as a 
place to visit with friends and 
sleep. 
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Lines are another one of those 
things A&I students must get 
used to. There are lines to reg­
ister, buy books, pick-up 
checks, eat, and on and on . It 
doesn't help to get there early 
because everyone else comes up 
with the same idea. And you 
better not take "cuts," because 
you'll wind up on the "wanted" 
list. 

Mail is that stuff you never 
get. Everyday you go check 
your mail box which is empty 
everyday. But, finally one day 
you notice something in the 
box. You hurriedly open it up, 
only to discover it's a fine from 
the library. 

The mall is where everyone 
gathers between classes. On a 
balmy day you can see loads of 
kids sprawled out on benches 
and under trees. Occasionall y 
the fountain is filled with deter­
gent producing a fairyland pic­
ture. 

The museum is that place 
behind Manning Hall that no 
one visits. Students either don't 
know about it or don't have any 
"class." It's a well kept 
museum with quite a collection 
of historical items. Incidently 
there's no admission charge - so 
go. 
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Students might not make it to 

class during the day but you can 
bet they 'll be at the Brass Mon­
key or some other place that 
night. I guess night has some 
mysterious power which draws 
students out. You may be sip­
ping on a mug of bee r and 
remembe r you have an exam 
the next morning; but you'll just 
keep sipping and secretly ask for 
di vine guidance. 

Out of state students are the 
kids that are either filthy rich or 
dirt poor, due to the outrageous 
tUltlOn. They are a lso 
extremely homesick . On lonely 
nights they probably ask - "Is it 
reall y worth it?" 

It seems you pay $5 for a 
parking permit and you never 
can find a parking place . Com­
mute rs rea ll y get the shaft; 
be cause they come bare l y in 
time for their first class and 
then it takes at least ten min­
utes to find a place to park and 
about another t e n minutes t o 
walk to class. The same holds 
true for those who live off cam­
pus and bring the ir car to 
school . Even parking your bike 
becomes a hassle at times . Face 
it man - all of you who think 
you're saving time by bringing 
your car - you're not - it' s faster 
to walk. 

38 

)( 
Students might not make it to 

class during the day but you can 
bet they 'll be at the Brass Mon­
key or some other place that 
night. I guess night has some 
mysterious power which draws 
students out. You may be sip­
ping on a mug of beer and 
remembe r you have an exam 
the next morning; but you'll just 
keep sipping and secretly ask for 
di vine guidance. 

Out of state students are the 
kids that are either filthy rich or 
dirt poor , due to the outrageous 
tUltlOn. They are a lso 
extremel y homesick . On lonely 
nights they probably ask - .. Is it 
reall y worth it? .. 

It seems you pay $5 for a 
parking permit and you never 
can find a parking place . Com­
muters rea ll y ge t the shaft ; 
be ca use they come ba re l y in 
time for their first class and 
then it takes at least ten min­
utes to find a place to park and 
about another t e n minutes t o 
walk to class. The same holds 
true for those who live off cam­
pus and bring the ir car to 
school. Even parking your bike 
becomes a hassle at times . Face 
it man - all of you who think 
you're saving time by bringing 
your car - you're not - it' s faster 
to walk. 



39 39 



40 40 



4 1 4 1 



42 42 



The drama department 
always produces some really 
"fine" plays. But, much too 
often the apathetic A&I students 
seldom turn out. Attending the 
performances doesn't cost any 
more than a couple of mugs of 
beer. 

Pool tournaments ha ve 
become popular at A&I . There 
ha ve been tourneys for guys, 
gals, and mixed doubles. Stu­
dents spend a lot of time prac­
ticing their shots even if it 
means skipping a class or two. 

Quizzes sound a little childish 
but regardless they are given at 
A&I. There are math quizzes, 
English quizzes and countless 
others. Profs defend quizzes, 
saying, "It's a way to make 
sure you're keeping up." 

Registration is the day you 
swea t, curse, cry and pray. You 
get yourself emotionally pre­
pared by saying "I know it's 
going to be a long day; but I'll 
make it." Half the time you 
just barely make it. You dis­
cover what legs are for on this 
day. Because it never fails you 
are sent back and fonh to obtain 
material needed before entering 
hell - the library. After you 
finally get through the exit 
door, you're relieved but 
relieved but only for a shon 
while until you discover, you 
didn't get the classes you 
wanted. 

43 

The drama department 
always produces some really 
"fine" plays. But, much too 
often the apathetic A&I students 
seldom turn out. Attending the 
performances doesn't cost any 
more than a couple of mugs of 
beer. 

Pool tournaments ha ve 
become popular at A&I. There 
ha ve been tourneys for guys, 
gals, and mixed doubles. Stu­
dents spend a lot of time prac­
ticing their shots even if it 
means skipping a class or two. 

Quizzes sound a little childish 
but regardless they are given at 
A&I. There are math quizzes, 
English quizzes and countless 
others. Profs defend quizzes, 
saying, "It's a way to make 
sure you're keeping up." 

Registration is the day you 
swea t, curse, cry and pray. You 
get yourself emotionally pre­
pared by saying "I know it's 
going to be a long day; but I'll 
make it." Half the time you 
just barely make it. You dis­
cover what legs are for on this 
day. Because it never fails you 
are sent back and fonh to obtain 
material needed before entering 
hell - the library. After you 
finally get through the exit 
door, you're relieved but 
relieved but only for a shon 
while until you discover, you 
didn't get the classes you 
wanted. 

43 



Sleep just isn't in an A&I stu­
dent's dictionary. You may go 
to class till only about 2 p. m. , 
leaving you ample time for a 
na p. Instead you go out to the 
tennis courts or play handball. 
After supper you're out on the 
prowl or shooting the bull with a 
friend. Before long it's only a 
couple of hours before your 
morning class. So much for 
catching zzzs . 

Stud ying is getting slee py 
after reading a couple of pages 
in your history book. Studying 
to many is also a thing of the 
past. Eve ryone has diffe rent 
methods and ideas of studying. 
Yet all students' primary con­
cern is to pass the course by 
either studying or cheating. 

Swingers at A&I are not only 
cool chicks but also dedicated 
and full of enthusiasm . They 
practice with the band on hot 
afternoons perfecting their flag 
and marching routines . Neither 
cold, rain nor mud puddles can 
stop these girls. 

Tickets are those little white 
pieces of paper that appear on 
many car windshields, after you 
get out of class. You soon dis­
cover you have to pay a dollar 
fee or else your grades will be 
withheld . There are other types 
of tickets at A&I - football 
tickets which students didn't get 
this semester. Stude nts we re 
heard asking, "Why didn't we 
get football tickets at registra­
tion? Did they run out?" "Who 
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Knows?" Maybe the re was a 
paper shortage. Anyway, tick­
ets were not printed so students 
had to use their I. D. 's to get 
into the games, which became 
another hassle for those who lost 
their I. D. 's and had to fork out 
$3 to get new ones. 

Twirlers are smiling girls that 
highlight the band's perform­
ance during half-time . They 
parade down the field with 
grace and pride t ossing that 
slippe ry baton. The aud ience 
always wonders how they man­
age to perfect their perform­
ance without receiving bruises . 
Maybe they have also learned to 
hide bruises. 

EL CHILE, A Raza Unida 
newspaper, is one of the news­
papers which have circulated 
this campus. Others such as EL 
MACHETE, and EL AZOTE, 
have also come into existence 
but have disappeared. These 
papers tend to deal with the 
Chicano movement. They have 
been met with both approval by 
some students and disapproval 
by the administration and fac ­
ulty . 

A&I has its share of vamps. 
Yet, male professors fail to rec­
ognize them. The professors 
soon fall into the hands of these 
seductively charming women. 
The vamps, within two weeks of 
the first day of class, are 
assured a passing grade with lit­
tle effort on their part. The rest 
of the students suffer the whole 
semester, wondering if they'll 
make it or not. ';'7 
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Vandalism occurs at A&I 
campus occasionally. Usually 
it's nothing major. Often rest­
rooms are vandalized by stu­
dents who live off-campus and 
run out of toilet paper. Girls are 
seen walking out of restrooms 
with rolls of toilet paper stuffed 
in purses, coats or T-shirts. 

Ask any Kingsville resident 
about the weather and they will 
tell you "it's just beautiful." 
But it's not. It's hot, humid, 
and rainy. In the morning you 
wear a sweater, in the afternoon 
a short sleeve shirt or a halter, 
and at night you wear the 
sweater again. The weather is 
constantly changing. Fair, 
partl y cloudy - that's South 
Texas weather. 

X-rays are part of an every­
day occurence in the life of our 
football players. Football play­
ers are placed on pedestals at 
A&I, and rightly so. Thus, 
when a player sustains an injury 
he is immediately off to get an 
x-ray. 
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Yawning is something A&I 
students can simply not control. 
During eight 0' clock classes 
someone usually yawns after 
about ten minutes of lecture. In 
a flash the entire class begins 
yawning. Sometimes even the 
professor can be caught in the 
act. 

Zilch is how you feel after 
flunking that dumb exam; how 
you feel after that fine looking 
chick or dude who you've had 
your eye on gives you that flake 
off look; and how you feel after 
partying too much the night 
before. 

51 

Yawning is something A&I 
students can simply not control. 
During eight 0' clock classes 
someone usually yawns after 
about ten minutes of lecture. In 
a flash the entire class begins 
yawning. Sometimes even the 
professor can be caught in the 
act. 

Zilch is how you feel after 
flunking that dumb exam; how 
you feel after that fine looking 
chick or dude who you've had 
your eye on gives you that flake 
off look; and how you feel after 
partying too much the night 
before. 

51 



52 52 



53 53 



El Rancho Wins Sweepstakes 
The 1976 El Rancho experienced many production 

setbacks, but pulled it all together for a fall delivery. 
Everyone except Sarita Gardner, editor, and Larry 

Arce, assistant editor, were newcomers to the college 
yearbook staff. A few delays occurred when one staff 
member graduated, another student taught and another 
suffered hospitalization because of a car accident. 
This resulted in an overturn of staff and adjustments 
and "on-the-job" training were daily occurrences. 

The editor was not officially appointed until Sep­
tember, which was one of the reasons for a later deliv­
ery. Also the move to Manning Hall proved a bit disap­
pointing when the photographers darkroom was absent. 

The El Rancho-South Texan got their darkroom produc­
tion underway by January. 

At the TIPA convention in Nacogdoches, the 1975 El 
Rancho, under the editorship of Don Taylor, received 
Sweepstakes and four individual awards. Lynda Stover 
received a third place for Student Life copy; Sarita 
Gardner got a third for organizations copy, Pancho 
Lopez received a second for sports photo and Lopez and 
Rick Garza, together received a second for feature 
photo. 

These awards encouraged the Bicentennial El Rancho 
staff to endure the disorganization of the year and to 
try to repeat the honor. 

Larry Arce. assistant editor ; David Vasquez. sports ; David Schnitz. photographer ; Tom Daughters. photographer ; D Sarita Gardne r . editor; 
Lilly Flores . students life and depanments 
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David Flores. sports editor; Leo Alarcon. reporter; J. D. Hofer. advertising assistant; Terri Ackerman. assistant editor; Noe Rodri­
guez. advertising manager; Sylvia Barrera. reporter; Roxann Jones. copy editor; Richard Botello. photographer; Ignacio Garcia. 
reporter ; Anita Camarillo. reporter; Kaye Presley. editor. 

South Texan Undergoes Changes 
The South Texan campus newspaper experienced 

several beneficial changes this year. An additional 
reporter and assistant advertising manager were 
added to the staff. There was a production change 
from hot type to cold type which reduces the costs 
and involves more students in the actual production 
process. Another innovation that took place this year 
was the move to a larger office in Manning Hall. 
However. even the benefits could not compensate for 
the staff being without an advisor. 

During the Texas Intercollent Press Association 

convention (TIP A). David Flores received a first 
place for general news story and a third place for 
sports feature. Roxann Jones placed second for her 
constitutional theories story. 

Kay L. Presley. editor. received a $500 Corpus 
Christi Press Club scholarship and an Erard scholar­
ship of $240. David Flores also received a Corpus 
Christi Press Club scholarship for %kOO. 

Mr. I. Q. Vidaurri served as advisor for both the 
South Texan and El Rancho. 
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FRONT ROW : Mark Pester. Ron Redman. Mike Cortinas. Beto Martinez. Leo Garza. Howard Stanzell. ROW 2: Delbert Seese. 
Paul Isham. Gary Messer. Blair Dear. John Ayoub . ROW 3: Mike Wilson. Jim Harbor. Mark Huff. Susan Qualia. Tom Godwin. 

KTAI Celebrates 6th Year 
KT AI. A&I's campus radio station, celebrated 

its sixth birthday with a remote transmission at the 
mall. Contests, prizes, bike and footraces made 
the gathering a special occasion. A party for the 
disc jockeys followed. 

The station was on the air from 12 a. m. to 12 
p. m. Monday through Friday. The station carried 
a variety of music and special shows; from jazz, 
oldies , Mexican music to classical. 

"The Forum" was a special show hosted by Blair 

Dear where students called in and asked questions 
of the guests. Among the guests were President 
Robins, Dr. Elliot, and other campus and student 
body leaders. 

During the spring semester, new people joined 
the crew and added a new variety of music, 
including hard rock and the disco dance sounds. 

A move to Manning Hall is expected for the sta­
tion in September. 
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Dr. Gerald B. Robins, President I. Q. Vidaurri, Director of Student Services. 

Dr . Frederick G . Harvey, Assistant President. 
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Dr. W. Floyd Elliott. Vice President for Student Services. 

Th e odore Papageo rge. Direc tor of Pe rso nn e l and Equal 
Employment Opportunity Officer . 

Dr. Mario Benitez. Vice Preside nt for Academic Affairs and 
Dean. 
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Dr . De nnis Ford. Dean of Business; Dr. Ernest Franke . Dean of Engineering; Dr . 
John Glock. Dean of Education ; Dr. R. R. Hinojosa -Smith. Dean of Ans and Sci­
ences; Dr. John C. Rayburn. Dean of Graduate Studies. 

Dr. Jerry Bogner. Director of Continuing Education. Lt. Col. Clarence Wittman. Military Science. 
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Dr. William Hall, Dean of Admissions and Registrar. 

David Boothby , Comptroller; Steven Crandall, Business Manager; Otis Davis, Bookstore Manager; Edward 
Wille y, Duplica ting Office Supervisor. 
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Otis Davis . Bookstore Manager. 

--. 

Dr . Herbe rt Ha ynes . Director of the Computation Center . 
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--. 

Dr. Herbert Haynes , Director of the Computation Center. 
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Rob Allen. Director of Photo Center; William Holmes . News and Information Services Director. 

Randy Lynch. Director of the Alumni Association. 
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Randy Lynch. Director of the Alumni Association. 
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Dr. William Ewert, University Physician ; Lawrence Knippa, Director of Physical Plant; Dr. James Prewitt, 
Student Union Director; Sessia Wyche, Assistant Director of Student Aid; Davey Ansel, Supervisor of Building 
Maintenance. 

Hansell Plauche, Director of Student Housing; Miss Margaret White, Assistant 
Director of Student Housing . 
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Paul Goode , Head Librarian; Mrs . Jimmie Piquet, Director of University Museum . 
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Dr. Ward Albro . III. History 
Dr. Salvadore Alvarez. Education 
Dr. Pa t Armstrong. Business 
Maj. Francisco Ball. ROTC 
Dr. Paul Barlow. Educat ion 

William Barron . Education 
Dr. Jo Beran . Chemistry 
Dr. Eldon Brinley . HPE 
Dr. Robert Brown . Psy-Soc. 
Earl Herrick . English 

Dr . George Cook. English 
Sylvia Curry . Music 
Dr. Robert Davidson. Philosophy 
Dr . Maxine Delmare. English 
S. Burgin Dunn . Physics 

Franklin Evans . Computer Science 
Cathe rine Flagie llo. Psy-Soc. 
Dr . Thom as Foste r . Education 
Dr. Ernest Franke . Engineering 
Paul Goode . Head Libra rian 

Dr. Darroll Grant . Agriculture 
A. F. Gross. Industria l Arts 
Azuncena Guerra . Education 
Johnnie Mae Haun . Education 
Dwight Hazlett. ACC/EDP 

Je rry W. Hedrick . Industrial Arts 
David A . Herfort. Music 
Dr. Lione l D. He wett. Physics 
William Holmes . News Se rvice 
Dr. Paul Hoopes. Political Science 

Dr. Leslie Hunter. History 
Inga M . Irvine . English 
Dr. Eugene Jekel. Educa tion 
Dr. Gary Jolliff . Agriculture 
Be verly Jones . Education 

Katherine Kantz . English 
Emerson Korges . Engineering 
Dr . a lan Druse. Physics 
Cpt. Harold Lance . ROTC 
Dr. Le land Le Maste r. Industrial Arts 
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Dr. Francisco Lopez- Herrera. Modern Languages 
Ophelia Manning. Home Economics 
Dr. Ronald Marcotte. Chemistry 
Kenneth Martin. ACC/EDP 
Dr. Mary Mattingly. Political Science 

Dr. R. H . McCoy. Biology 
James McIntyre. Business 
Dr. Ronald McKenzie. Education 
Robert Medrano. Education 
Lynn Meierhoffer. Modern Languages 

Dr. Gunter Mende. History 
Maria Morales. Education 
Dr. Philip Morey. Math 
Ned Morris. Librarian 
Dr. David Neher. Agriculture 

Dr. James Norwine. Geo.-Geo. 
Fred Nuesch. University Publications 
Dr. Alberto Olivares. Chemistry 
Nancy Palmer. English 
Dr. Paul Palmer. History 
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Dr. David Pratt. Biology 
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Alfred Tellinghuisen. Music 
Dr. Michael Tinker. English 
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Dr. Emma Van Laningham. Home Economics 
Joyce Vilseck. Math 
Dr. Woodrow Wallace. Business 
Dr. Henry Weathers. Business 
F. B. Wines. Agriculture Ed . 
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Agriculture 
Dr. Stanley R. Anderson. 

agriculture dean. resigned from 
his position this fall. Dr. David 
Neher has been serving as acting 
dean since the middle of 
November. 

Extensive programs are under 
way in forage quality. animal 
reproductive physiology and 
wildlife management. 

Progress by the College of 
Agriculture includes the addi­
tion of two new faculty mem­
bers and approval of A&I 's Board 
of Directors for construction of a 
new 22. 000 square foot labora­
tory and classroom building. 

The College hosted area ten 
advisers in September. a lead­
ership contest in November. a 
judging contest in April. the 
Future Farmers of America Con­
vention in May. and the Central 
Power and Light FFA awards 
banquet in August. 

Students take nbtes during Ago 402 class. Student in Ago Mech. grinds file. 
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Students often visit the An Gallery. 

Nancy Harrison cleans up after printing a picture using a woodcut. 

Mike Brown works on a project for his 
ceramics class. 

Art 
Once again the Art depart­

ment has beautified Texas A&I 
campus by a series of 15 to 20 
exhibitions in the Art Gallery 
and 20 to 30 student exhibitions 
in the hall ways of the Art 
department, library, and little 
theatre. 

This year's visiting artist and 
instructor of art was Sally Bar­
bier, who received a B.A. from 
Nichols State in Louisiana and a 
M.F.A. from the University of 
Wisconsin. 

Ms. Barbier instructed a new 
course in ceramics design and 
sculpture. Another new course, 
advertising art was taught by 
Jose Martinez, Jr. , instructor 
and advertizing art specialist. 

New equipment purchased 
this year includes an art welder 
and airbrush equipment which is 
now being installed. 
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Bible Chairs 
Texas A&I offers Bible courses 

in four off-campus Bible Chairs. 
Although this work counts 
toward university credit, the 
Bible Chairs are supported 
e ntire l y by their respective 
religious denominations. 

The Baptist Student Union has 
regular actl VI tles to raise 
money for summer missions. 
Hot luncheons are sold for 50¢ 
every Wednesday and special 
events such as Fish Fries are 
held for this purpose. 

The other Bible Chairs, The 
Campus Christian Fellowship, 
The Church of Christ and The 
University Catholic Center, 
also engage in various activities 
to raise money. All the Bible 
Chairs encourage spiritual 
growth and offer counseling. 

Mr. H. Cole. director of the Church of 
Christ lectures to a Bible class. 

Students listen to Bruce Peterson. director of the BSU. as he lectures in his Bible 101 
class. 

Bible 301 taught by Don Small. director of The Campus Christian Fe llowship. is in 
session. 
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Biology students collect venom at Freer Rattlesnake Roundup . 

Biology 
The Biology department is 

still stressing research as a part 
of its basic function of teach­
ing. according to Dr. J. Talmer 
Peacock. department chair­
man. 

A group of graduate and 
undergraduate students has been 
working on the tissue culture 
program under funding of a 
$20.000 grant from the Texas 
A&I University System. 

The Biomedical Research 
program for Minority Students 
has involved members of the 
research team in "catching" or 
isolating viruses under funding 
of a $225.997. three-year grant 
from the National Institute of 
Health through the United 
States Department of Health 
Education and Welfare. 

Two new courses appeared in 
this years catalog. Bio. 209 • 
(Introductory Plant Taxonomy). 
was offered this fall. The sec­
ond addition was Bio. 332. 
(Non-Flowering Plants). The 
latter course will be offered 
every other year. 

Student in Biology 104 compares lecture notes to specimen during lab. 
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English 
No department is in contact 

with as many students as the 
English Department, since the 
department serves as a service 
department for all majors. 

This year the department has 
been under the direction of Dr. 
Hildegard Schmalenbeck, 
chairman. She recently 
directed the self-study for the 
Southern Association. 

Among some of the special 
events sponsored by the depart­
ment are the annual book sale 
and the annual workshop-con­
ference for South Texas high 
school and college English 
teachers. 

Cliff Notes - a lifesaver! 

Dr. Cook lectures to his English class . 

Students read along with professor . 
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Students examine work before class. 

Chemistry 
Under the direction of Dr. Jo 

A. Beran, new chairman for the 
Chemistry department, envi­
ronmental chemistry was 
expanded with the aid of a 
recent $4,100 National Science 
Foundation grant. 

Two new courses have been 
added to the department. And a 
minor in environmental science 
has been added to the program. 
Field trips to the Texas Air 
Control Board in Austin, DuPont 
in Victoria and Celanese in 
Clarkwood and Bishp contrib­
uted to the program. 

The department also spon­
sored a high school-college 
chemistry teachers interface 
and a high school chemistry 
tournament . 

The American Chemical 
Society (student affiliate chap­
ter) is sponsored by the Chemis­
try department. 
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Geology­
Geography 

Three major research projects 
are currently being tackled by 
faculty members of the Geogra­
phy and Geology department. 

Dr. John L. Russell, Dr. Ray­
mond W. Suhm and Dr. James 
Norwine in conjunction with 
Dr. Henry H. Hildebrandt of the 
Biology department are con­
ducting a four-year ecological 
study of Alazan Bay, an arm of 
Baffin Bay. 

Norwin, working with Dr. 
John Fucik of the A&I Citrus 
Center in Weslaco, is doing a 
study of climatic control of gra­
pefruit production in the Val­
ley. 

Suhm, working with Mrs. 
Jimmie Picquet of the John 
Conner Museum, is doing 
research to date mammoth 
bones discovered south of 
Kingsville. Students in Geology 101 lab examine rocks. 

Fermin Munoz. a student in the Geography 315 lab. works on his map. 
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Students listen intently during an Ethnic Studies lecture . 

Dr. Reyna expresses his views in his Ethnic Studies 401 class . 

Dr. Reyna lectures to his Ethnic Stud­
ies 201 class . 

Ethnic Studies 
This fall the Ethnic Center 

offered three more courses. Last 
fall the center also began offer­
ing a minor in Mexican-Ameri­
can studies in conjunction with 
the departments of Art. Geog­
raphy-Geology. History. Psy­
chology-Sociology. and Span­
ish. 

Dr. Jose R. Reyna. director. 
said the center places special 
emphasis on Chicano culture 
since Chicanos compose 40 per­
cent of the population of the 
university and almost 90 per­
cent of the minority body. 

According to Reyna. Chicano 
students need to study their cul­
ture and become aware of their 
history and their contributions 
to this area. which he feels are 
many. 
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HPE 
UIL activities including boys' 

basketball and girls ' volleyball, 
a gymnastics meet, a dance 
re vie w presented by the dance 
classes, womens' athletics, and 
inuamurals for women and men 
are some of the special events 
which were sponsored by the 
Health and Physical Education 
Department this year. 

New courses added to the pro­
gram were scuba diving and 
spring board diving. 

Field trips taken by the 
department included a trip by 
scuba divers to the Gulf of Mex­
ico and a weekend outing by the 
outdoor education class. 

New sports equipment was 
purchased for many of the 
classes. 

The department sponsors the 
H.P.E. Club. 

Students exercise vigorously during a weight training class. 

Girls limber up during a dance class. Boys practice handball techniques. 
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Dr. Mende discusses the rise of great world powers. 

Dr. Hicks reviews with class before a test. 

Dr. Baker discusses the different 
aspects of Texas History. 

History 
Two promotions and the 

awarding of a fellowship were 
among the major events in the 
History depanment this year. 

Dr. Gunter Mende and Dr. 
Paul Soifer each were promoted 
from instructor to assistant pro­
fessor. Both were awarded doc­
trine degrees in spring 1975. 
Mende's was from the Univer­
sity of California at Irvine Soi­
fer's, Pennsylvania State. 

Dr. Harry R. Huebel received 
a Fellowship in Residence for 
College Teachers at Dart­
mouth, sponsored by the 
National Endowment for the 
Humanities. 

This year the department 
offered a new course. the 
teaching of history. It offered 
methods. materials. and tech­
niques for the teaching of his­
tory on the junior and senior 
high school levels. 
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Home 
Economics 

Two new courses in foods and 
nutrition were offered by the 
Home Economics department 
this year. The new courses were 
Cultural and Economic Aspects 
of Foods (H. E. 417). and Expe­
rimental Foods (418). 

Another addition to the 
department was the new man­
agement cottage. which will 
open in the fall of 1976. The 
courses which will be offered at 
the new facility include: Food 
Clinic and Quantity Cookery. 
Textile Research Laboratories. 
Clothing Construction and Pat­
tern Design. 

The cottage will provide 
three apartment units which 
will house four students per 
apartment. The apartments will 
be designed to fit a low. mid­
dle-class and high income 
bracket. 

Home Economic students prepare a 
meal. 

Home Economic students pin and baste material before sewing. 

Student works on sewing assignment. 
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Student in IA 306 examines machinery . 

Student trims rock in Lapidary class. 

Industrial Arts 
The Industrial Arts depart­

ment acquired new equipment 
this year. This consisted of: two 
color enlargers for photography, 
one vacuum forming machine 
and one injection molding 
machine both for the plastics 
classes, and one varifont letter­
ing machine for the audio-vis­
ual aids classes. 

The department hosted the 
19th annual South Texas Indus­
trial Arts Vocational Fair this 
spring under the direction of 
Herschel Kelly. 

The Industrial Arts Club, 
sponsored by the department, is 
active in statewide industrial 
arts associations. A group of IA 
Club members attended the 
spring meeting of the Texas 
Industrial Arts Association this 
year. 
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Journalism 
The Journalism de partment 

was housed in Manning Hall this 
fall. 

The department had one lab­
oratory for ne ws- e ditorial 
courses, one general classroom, 
one study room for journalism 
majors and two offices for the 
faculty. 

The Media Society, a jour­
nalism student organization, 
along with the department 
sponsored symposiums, panel 
discussions, and colloquiums 
with area journalists participat­
ing. 

The department offered for 
the first time this year three 
LULAC scholarships - two spon­
sored by the Corpus Christi 
LULAC chapter and one spon­
sored by the Kingsville chapter 
- for Mexican-American jour­
nalism majors. 

Dr. Hari Dam lectures to class. 

Students t ype stories in Dr. James Herring 's feature writ ing class . Journalism student works on story . 

88 

Journalism 
The Journalism department 

was housed in Manning Hall this 
fall. 

The department had one lab­
oratory for news-editorial 
courses, one general classroom, 
one study room for journalism 
majors and two offices for the 
faculty. 

The Media Society, a jour­
nalism student organization, 
along with the department 
sponsored symposiums, panel 
discussions, and colloquiums 
with area journalists participat­
ing. 

The department offered for 
the first time this year three 
LULAC scholarships - two spon­
sored by the Corpus Christi 
LULAC chapter and one spon­
sored by the Kingsville chapter 
- for Mexican-American jour­
nalism majors. 

Dr. Hari Dam lectures to class. 

Students type stories in Dr. James Herring's feature writing class . Journalism student works on story. 



Graduate student prepares his numerical analysis homework. 

Graduate 
Studies 

The School of Graduate Stud­
ies offered two new educational 
masters programs in Special 
Education and Early Childhood 
Education. According to Dr. 
John C. Rayburn, dean of the 
College of Graduate Studies, 
these new programs were well 
received this summer. 

Courses were also offered this 
fall for a Doctor of Education in 
Bilingual Education degree. 

Recently the Graduate Coun­
cil was reorganized into a 16-
member governing board, as the 
college implements recommen­
dations of the Southern Associa­
tion. This fall marks the reor­
ganization of the whole struc­
ture of the graduate program 
under these recommendation. 

Students in a graduate level education class . taught by Dr. Cokendolpher. listen intently to a speaker. 
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Military 
Science 

This year, the Reserve Offi­
cers ' Training Corps (ROTC), 
unde r the l e adership of PMS 
Clarence Whitman and Cadet 
Lt. Colonel Julian Zapata, 
sponsored several activities and 
new developments. 

Among the activitie s spon­
sored were Parents' Day Open 
House, a Homecoming barbe ­
cue, the Military Ball, and a 
colorful 50th Anniversary 
Homecoming. ROTC also spon­
sored the A&I Orienterring Club 
which is a member of the 
National Orienteering Federa­
tion. 

The Military Science depart­
ment is in the process of build­
ing a modern, fully air-condi­
tioned, rifle range and supply 
complex. 

A conduct leadership Labora­
tory and a Hand-To-Hand Com­
bat Team were two new devel ­
opments in the department. 

ROTC students listen during a classroom lecture . 

The Kings ' Rifles perform on Parents' Day . 

The Color Guard is at attention . 
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Students prepare for a Math class . 

Dr. Young lectures to his Math 108 
class. 

Mathematics 
New graduate courses 

designed for the secondary 
school teachers have been 
added to the Mathematics 
de partment. These courses are 
aimed at problem solving. 

Also added to the curriculum 
was Mathematics for Elemen­
tary School Teachers, (Math 
221), which covers selected 
topics from logic, sets, ele­
mentary number theory and 
number systems. 

A special event sponsored by 
the department this year was 
"Problem of the Week." 

The department installed an 
AP terminal on the third floor of 
Rhode Hall which is connected 
to the main computer in Col­
lege Hall. The terminal has 
been used extensively in statis­
tical and optimization prob­
lems. 

91 

Students iJrepare for a Math class . 

Dr . Young lectures to his Math 108 
class. 

Mathematics 
New graduate courses 

designed for the secondary 
school teachers have been 
added to the Mathematics 
department. These courses are 
aimed at problem solving. 

Also added to the curriculum 
was Mathematics for Elemen­
tary School Teachers, (Math 
221), which covers selected 
topics from logic, sets, ele­
mentary number theory and 
number systems. 

A special event sponsored by 
the department this year was 
"Problem of the Week." 

The department installed an 
AP terminal on the third floor of 
Rhode Hall which is connected 
to the main computer in Col­
lege Hall. The terminal has 
been used extensively in statis­
tical and optimization prob­
lems. 

91 



92 

Music 
The Music Department was 

again responsible for about 70 
concerts. Participants in these 
concerts include department 
organizations, individual con­
certs by junior, senior or gradu­
a te students, f acuIty recitals 
and performances by guest art­
ists. The department held its 
22nd annual Fine Arts Festival 
in the Spring and the Jazz Festi­
val in February. 

This year the department 
approved a new course, second 
semester of conducting, which 
will begin next fall. The 
department acquired a portable 
video-tape outfit which is being 
used in ensemble and perform­
ance classes. 

Students practice during piano class taught by instructor Sylvia Curry. 

Joseph Bellamah . associate professor. instructs Joe Thomas during a trumpet lesson. Ray Moreno practices during a private 
applied voice lesson. 
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German insuuctor. James D. Tryer. lectures to his German 212 class. 

Students in Spanish 222 look over their textbook. 

Dr. John Sauvageau instructs his Span­
ish class. 

Modern 
Languages 

Two new Spanish courses were 
added to the Modern Languages 
curriculum. They were Spanish 
105 and 106 which are geared 
for the student who has never 
had Spanish in high school. but 
has a Latin-American back­
ground. 

This March Dr. Rosalina R. 
Rovira. chairman. and Miss 
Mae Dell Schiller. instructor. 
sponsored the A. A. T . S . P . 
National Examinations. Area 
students from the different high 
schools competed in this event. 

More than 1.600 high schools 
and seven colleges attended the 
annual meeting of the Texas 
Association of German Students 
last spring. A department 
member. James D. Tryer. was 
coordinator of the event. 
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Political 
Science 

Women's Studies, Energy and 
Environment, Computer Appli­
cations, and Public Administra­
tion: Planning in Local Govern­
ment were the new courses 
added the political science 
department . 

In October, Dr. J. D. Phaup 
took his PS 301A American 
State Government class to Aus­
tin for a field trip. Their visit 
consisted of various tours 
through the state agencies and 
inside the capital. While visit­
ing the senate , the group was 
able to attend the trail of O. P. 
Carrillo. 

Several of the department 
professors, Dr. Edward Su, Dr. 
Fredrick Matkin, and Dr. Paul 
Hoopes are teaching Continuing 
Education Courses in the sur­
rounding areas. Students concentrate on lecture of the systems. 

Students discuss examination of the special topics in political science. 
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Professor explains physics problem to students . 

Physics 
This fall the Physics depan­

ment offered a new course 
designe d for music majors, 
entitled "The Acoustical Foun­
dations of Music. " 

The depanment also added a 
second semester to its astron­
omy course (Physics 121-122). 

Dr. Orlan Kruse was elected a 
Fellow in the Texas Academy of 
Science . He is among seven 
Texas scientists so honored by 
the academy. This gives the 
depanment two Fellows in the 
academy, as S. Burgin Dunn 
was so named in 1971. 

Also this year the depanment 
was bequeathed the shon-wave 
station of the late Herschel F. 
Rawls. As a result a Herschel F. 
Rawls Memorial Amateur Radio 
Club was organized and began 
operations this year. 

95 

Professor explains physics problem to students. 

Physics 
This fall the Physics depan­

ment offered a new course 
designed for music maj ors , 
entitled' 'The Acoustical Foun­
dations of Music ... 

The depanment also added a 
second semester to its astron­
omy course (Physics 121-122). 

Dr. Orlan Kruse was elected a 
Fellow in the Texas Academy of 
Science. He is among seven 
Texas scientists so honored by 
the academy. This gives the 
depanment two Fellows in the 
academy, as S. Burgin Dunn 
was so named in 1971. 

Also this year the depanment 
was bequeathed the shon-wave 
station of the late Herschel F. 
Rawls. As a result a Herschel F. 
Rawls Memorial Amateur Radio 
Club was organized and began 
operations this year. 

95 



96 

Speech­
Drama 

In honor of the Bicentennial 
year, the Speech and Drama 
department presented "1976" 
this fall, in conjunction with 
A&I's Music department. 

Forensic students won two 
National awards at the 29th 
National Pi Kappa Delta Tour­
nament in Philadelphia; four 
trophies at the North Texas 
State Speech Festival, where 
A&I placed second overall; and 
six Lone Star Conference honors 
last spring. 

New courses offered by the 
department are Drama 414, 
(Bilingual Theatre) and Speech 
322, (Clinical Observation in 
Speech Pathology and Audiol­
ogy). The department sponsors 
Alpha Psi Omega, Footlites, 
and Pi Kappa Delta. Mrs. Patricia Goode explains the class schedule in Speech 305. 

Students in Speech 204 class practice debate techniques. 
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Psychology 502 students do the Wechler Intelligence test for practical experience. 

Students take exam in Ms. Catherine Flagiello's Soc . 123 class. 

Psychology -
Sociology 

The Psychology-Sociology 
Department offered three new 
courses this year - social strati­
fication, advanced human sex­
uality, and selected topics in 
psychology. 

Dr. Robert Brown, associate 
professor takes his juvenile 
delinquency and criminology 
classes on field trips. This year 
the juvenile class visited a state 
school and the criminology 
class visited prison units. 

The department purchased a 
biofeedback unit this year. 

The Sociology Club which 
was started last year is sponsored 
by the department. 
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Business 
A new $1.5 million business 

administration building was 
completed during early 1976. 
This new facility is designed for 
specialized instruction in busi­
ness studies with technically 
oriented laboratories and a full 
function computer cente r. 
Other features include a student 
lounge and a periodical reading 
room. 

The Business Administration 
Advisory Industry Council just 
completed its first year in a 
professional advisory capacity . 
It is composed of more than 20 
South Texas Business leaders 
and A&I faculty members who 
meet with Dr. Dennis Ford, 
dean of the college of Business 
Administration, to make rec­
ommendations concerning the 
needs and goals of A&I students 
going into business. Students take notes on standard cost variance . 

The professor lectures on the law of agency . partnerships and corpora tions in Business 342 class . 
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Joe Bentley processes data on peripheral devices in EDP 251. 

Dr. Dennis B. Ford. dean of Business Administration. discusses his ideas 
on the business department. 

The new business building is the newest addition 
to the A&! campus . 
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Raben Richter and Carl W. Willms. GE 101 students. set up the deerblind they made. 

David Soliz and Alfredo Ramirez. III. both NASA scholarship winners. are measuring the lift and drag of an 
airplane wing in a wind tunnel. 
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Students in Che mical Engineering class survey land. 

Engineering 
The College of Engineering 

added several new courses to 
their department and acquired 
new equipment. 

New courses in Electrical 
Engineering and Computer 
include: Principles and Appli­
cations of Engineering Electro­
magnectics (EE324). Inuoduc­
tion to Switching Circuits and 
Logic Design (EE 335). and 
Communication and Informa­
tion Theory (EE 336). 

Civil and Mechnical Engi­
neering added: Manufacturing 
Processes (ME 111). Design of 
Machine Elements (ME 450). 
Structural Analysis (CE 303). 
and Hydrology (CE 462). 

Communications systems test 
instruments. including function 
generators. an oscilloscope. 
and a digital multimeter were 
purchased by the college this 
year. 
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Education 
The College of Teacher Edu­

cation marked it's 50th anni­
versary this year. 

This year two new Master of 
Education degrees were offered 
by the college. The degrees, a 
Master of Education with a spe­
cializa tion in Early Childhood, 
and a Master of Education with 
specialization in Special Edu­
cation, are on the university's 
Plan II graduate program. This 
requires 36 hours of study and no 
thesis. 

The college sponsors the FT A 
(Future Teachers of America). 
One of their projects is giving 
free tickets at home games to 
high school students. 

The college also has quarterly 
publications concerning campus 
news and articles. These publi­
cations are sent to the area 
schools. Joe Soliz gives mini lesson in the Ed. 344 class. 

Students take part in group discussions in education class . Student studies notes. 
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Different crafts. created by education classes. may be seen in the display case in Rhode Hall each 
semester. 

Pam Duniver. a senior education major. assembles items for a class project. 
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A large crowd, 32,247, saw the Javelinas make the dedication of the new Aloha 
Stadium one that the Hawaiians will never forget. 

Leonard Avery and Johnny Barefie ld along with other Border Bandits pursue the 
Ha waiian Quan erback Alex Kaloi. 

George Franklin , playing his first game as full­
back , scored three of A&I' s touchdowns. 

Hogs Win 
Over Hawaii 

T e xas A&I score d the ir 15th 
victory in a 43-9 decision over the 
University of Hawaii. 

The Hoggies failed to capitalize 
on their first offensive series, but 
after an exchange of punts, the 
Hoggies drove for their first touch­
down. George Franklin, making 
his debut as fullback, scored A&I's 
first touchdown of the 1976 season 
on a two yard burst. 

Franklin, grabbe d the se cond 
half kick-off and raced 88 yards 
for his third touchdown, making it 
35- 0, Second string quarterback , 
Elvis Hartsfield, tossed a 34 yard 
scoring pass to Mike Jekel, and 
then connected with Rufus Green 
for the two point conversion for 
the final winning points. 
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Hogs Win 16th in a Row 
Texas A&I gained a new streak in the lavelinas' "Shootout No. I" dramatic, come-from-behind 24-21 

victory over the Abilene Christian Wildcats. 
ACC's first scoring attack came on an 82 yard pass, however the extra point attempt failed. George 

Franklin tied the game on the ensuing kick-off as he raced 97 yards for the Hoggies, Ritchie 's kick gave 
A&I a 7-6 lead. 

Most of the defense in the contest came in the first half, as A&I's winning touchdown was the only score 
after halftime. 

ACC had a first-and-goal on the Hog's one and a 21-17 lead. It was a supreme effon by the Border 
Bandits in making the game-winning stand on their own goal line . After a Larry Seidel fumble recovery, 
Larry Collins dashed into the end zone for the go-ahead point, to assure the Hoggies of their 16th 
consecutive win. 
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Junior Quarterback. Richard Ritchie . scores the Javelinas's first touchdown of the night against SFA on a two yard plunge . Rit­
chie completed 3-out-of- 3 for 94 yards and one touchdown . 

Hogs Steamroll SF A, 49-0 
The defending NAIA champions made its 1975 home debut a pleasing one in Javelina Stadium with a 

49-0 upset over Stephen F. Austin . 
Larry Grunewald, Larry Grady, and Leonard Avery each intercepted a lumberjack pass and Ray Evans 

recovered a fumble to set up four of A&I's touchdowns. The Hoggies took a 35-0 halftime lead, as A&I's 
first team unleashed a powerful attack for one quarter and a half, and then allowed the reservers to add 
more points on the board. 

Larry Urban, Freshman Quarterback, engineered two passing scoring drives on the fourth quarter for the 
final tally. 

The Border Bandits played a key role in the game as they registered their first shutout for the season. 
They also allowed the Lumberjacks only 174 yards in total offense. 
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A&I 36-ETS 7 
The J a velinas ran their unbeaten 

suing to 18, as they rolled to a 36-7 
win over the East Texas State Lions in 
"Shootout No.2." 

Playing before an estimated Parents' 
Day crowd of 16,000 the A&I "Border 
Bandits" held Aundra "Boomer" 
Thompson, who was the nation's lead­
ing rusher with an average of 195 yards 
per clash, to 56 yards on 18 carries and 
limited the Lions to 138 yards on 
offense, 

The play of the Javelinas' fame 
defense was the key to victory. The 
defensive highlight of the clash came 
early in the game when the Lions were 
held inside the A&I three-yard line. 

Glenn Starks. sure - handed receiver. scores a 
two- point conversion. 

Ray Evans David Hill . co-captains. hold up jersey no. 18. signifying 
the lavelinas 18th consecutive victory. 

Ray St Evans closes in on the ESTU quarterback. The Bandits held the 
powerful Lion offense to 138 total yards. 
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Members of the A&! squad and Coach Stineke's staff congratulate each other as they scored their 19th consecutive victory, a new 
school record. 

Larry Urban, second string quarterback, is brought down by some Lobo 
defenders after a short gain. 

A&I Wins 19th 
The SuI Ross Lobos haunted Texas A&I 

before the nationally ranked Iavelinas 
captured a 50-26 LSC victory. The Hog­
gies scored their 19th consecutive vic­
tory, a new school record. 

The Iavelinas scored on four of their 
first five possessions in the first half. 
Quarterback Richard Ritchie capped a 
67-yard drive with a three yard end 
around on fourth and goal for the score. 
The two point conversion put A&I on top 
8-0 in the opening period. 

PIa ying primary second stringers, the 
Hoggies watched the Lobos post 26 points 
in the second half and came within 10 
points of the Iavelinas with 10 left in the 
game. A&I scored two touchdowns in the 
final two minutes on a 70 yard scamper 
by Larry Collins and a 75 yard intercep­
tion return by Leaonard A very on the 
final play of the game. 
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Hogs Win 
Homecoming 
The Hoggies battled a steady 

downpour and a sturdy Angelo 
State University defense to cap­
ture a 14-6 victory before a 
wea therbea ten Homecoming 
crowd. 

The Javelina offense was held 
to a season's low in yards and 
points. but again it was the 
famed "Border Bandits" who 
came up with key plays neces­
sary for the victory. A&I capi­
talized on the game 's first turn­
over when Larry Grunewald 
recovered a fumble on the 
Angelo 34. The Hogs moved in 
on five plays with Ritchie pass­
ing to David Hill. 

The Border Bandits were the 
stars of the night when time 
after time they came up with 
the big plays. three times on 
the fourth down. 

On fourth and goal from the one. Larry Grune wald recovered his second crucial 
fumble to turn the ball over to the offense. 

Quarterback Richard Ritchie dodges a San Angelo 
State player for a few e xtra yards. 

The Hogs move in for their first score in five plays with Ritchie passing 
to David Hill. 
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The Hogs first scored on a 22 yard field goal on A&I's second pos­
session of the game . 

Hogs Bomb 
Tarleton 

Texas A&I, ranked No. 1 in both the Asso­
ciated Press and NAIA ratings, extended its 
winning streak to 21 with a 28-0 lopsided 
decision over the Tarleton State Texans. 

The running duo of Collins and Franklin 
blended harmoniously with the passing talents 
of quarterback Ritchie to give the Hogs an 
amassed 478 yards on offense. 

Tarleton's offense had four shots at the A&I 
goal line , but failed to score. 

LEFT: Johnny Barefield moves in on a Texan carrier 
before recovering a fumble which set up the game's 
first touchdown. ABOVE : George Franklin breaks 
through the Tarleton secondary for his first touchdown. 
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Members of the team listen to the commands of the Hoggie quarterback (16) 
Richard Ritchie . 

Th e Jav e lina t e am ge tting 
read y to go at it with the Sam 
Houston State Be arkats . 
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Quarterback Richard Ritchie engineered the 
nation's top-ranked small college team to a 
43-7 stomping over Sam Houston State to reg­
ister its 22nd consecutive triumph. 

Pia ying one of his finest games of the sea­
son, Ritchie led the Jave linas to an insur­
mountable 36-0 halftime lead - scoring on a 
10-yard quarterback keeper, kicking a 22-
yard field goal and three extra-point conver­
sions, and firing a four-yard scoring strike to 
flanker Glenn Starks. 

Also aiding the power-packed Javelina 
offense, which scored on six straight posses­
sions, were George Franklin, Hughie Shaw, 
and Larry Collins. Collins scored twice, with 
Franklin and Shaw both chipping in a score 
each. 
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Larry Collins is carried off after breaking the single game 
and career rushing records. 

George Franklin encourages the players from the sidelines 
after he amassed 130 yards. 

Hogs Beat Jackets 
The Javelines marched past the Howard Payne 

Yellow Jackets 48-18 before 13,000 Band Day 
fans. 

Collins rushed for 233 yards to give the sopho­
more speedster 2,306 career yards, eliminating 
the mark of 2,206 set in 1968-1972. His game 
total also wiped out the record of 223 yards set 
in 1952. 

The Hoggies' scores came on a 26-yard 
scamper by Franklin, a 22-yard pass from Rit­
chie to Hill, Herzik scored on a 51-yard pass, 
Hill again on a 15-yard pass, Franklin again on 
a 3-yard dive, Collins broke for 47 and then 
freshman quarterback, Larry Urban , engineered 
the final A&I score on an eight yard run. 

Leonard Avery and Larry Harvey, defensive backs . put the 
clamps on a YellowJacket receiver. 
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Terri Pattillo. one of A&I's women trainers. hands David Palmore a towel 
as he takes a breather during the game, 

Richard Ritchie broke the season total yardage 
record with his 249 yard performance, 

Hogs Defeat SWTSU 
Quarterback Richard Ritchie, set a new 

school record by engineering the Javelinas to 
a 28-8 victory over the Southwest Texas State 
Bobcats. 

Ritchie ended the season with 1,804 total 
yards. He had 1,309 passing and 495 rushing. 
He erased the record of 1,728 set in 1964. 

Led by Johnny Barefield and Howard Hen­
derson, who netted 11 and 10 unassisted tack­
les respectively, the Bandits limited the 
highly rated SWT attack to 147 yards total 
offense. 

An estimated crowd of 17.500. largest in the school's history for a 
home game . watched the Javelinas run their unbeaten string to 24. 
longest in the nation, 

116 

Terri Pattillo. one of A&I's women trainers. hands David Palmore a towel 
as he takes a breather during the game, 

Richard Ritchie broke the season total yardage 
record with his 249 yard performance, 

Hogs Defeat SWTSU 
Quarterback Richard Ritchie, set a new 

school record by engineering the Javelinas to 

a 28-8 victory over the Southwest Texas State 
Bobcats. 

Ritchie ended the season with 1,804 total 
yards. He had 1,309 passing and 495 rushing. 
He erased the record of 1,728 set in 1964. 

Led by Johnny Barefield and Howard Hen­
derson, who netted 11 and 10 unassisted tack­
les respectively, the Bandits limited the 
highly rated SWT attack to 147 yards total 
offense. 

An estimated crowd of 17.500. largest in the school's history for a 
home game. watched the Javelinas run their unbeaten string to 24. 
longest in the nation. 



Hogs Beat Oregon 37-0; 
Go for Final Shootout 

A Hoggie player is brought down by an Oregon College defender. 

A Javelina player makes a dash past an Oregon defender in the semi- fina l game. 

A small portion of the large that attended 
the semi-fina l game . 

No . 23 runs into a tough wall of Oregon players . 
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Hogs Beat Salem 
College. . 37-0 
BecomeNAIA 

Champions 

ABOVE: Joe Herzik avoids a Tiger defender. BELOW: Three Salem defenders stop 
one A&! player on an important play. 

A Hoggie Player reaches high to catch a pass thrown 
to him. 

An avid football fali cheers the Hogs on for another 
victory . 
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1975 Javelina Football Team 
Members of the NAIA championship team are, Left to Right, FIRST ROW: Johnny Maninez, Dan St. Leger, Larry 

Grady, Paul Rich, Larry Harvey, Joe Herzik, Howard Henderson, Ray Evans, David Hill, and Thurmond. SECOND 
ROW: Larry Seidel, Harry Ullom, Larry Collins, James Clay, Larry McFarland, Leonard Avery, Steve Fefer, Randy 
Brooks, John Massingill. THIRD ROW: Johnny Barefield, David Palmore, Clem Franks, Mike Hawkins, Rufus 
Green, Hughie Shaw, Maurice Ball, George Franklin, and Jeff Pyatte. FOURTH ROW: Larry Grunewald, Kim 
Evans, John Dawson, Eliseo Hernandez, Gary Allen, Elvis Hansfield, Carlos Perez, Bryan Sweeney, Larry Urban. 
FIFTH ROW: Larry Hin, Mike Jekel, Doug Walker, David Marquez, Mark Dizdar, Steven Glick, Richard 
Mayfield, Reginald Jones, and Jerry Wilbanks. SIXTH ROW: Dinno Rector, Stuan Donrburg, Richard Ritchie, Joe 
Henke, Lynn Frazier, Terry Russel, Billy John, Gary Davis, and Keven Gentry. SEVENTH ROW: Bill Lackey, Frank 
Wright, Bob Williams, Mark DeLaune, Jan Mumford, Clayton Roberts, Terri Pattillo, Dean Graves, and Rob 
Henderson. 
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Javelinas Have Disappointing Season 

1975-'76 Basketball Team 
Members of the '75-'76 cage crew are: FRONT ROW. L-to-R: James Krass. Dan Nau. Mike Mosrseon. Keven Flynn. Jasper 
Genyard. ROW TWO: Coach Don McDonald. Mark Linstrom. John Moring. James Johnson. Donny Elliott. Terri Patillo. ROW 
THREE: Ronnie Norrell. Gregg Byrd. David Williams. Kenny Kasper. and Ken Green. assistant coach. 
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Coach McDonald discusses strat egy with 
players. 

r 
Keven Flynn attempts a fifteen foot shot. 

James Johnson gets ready to add 2 more points. 

James Krass goes up for the ball before a la rge 
crowd. 

PIa yers Byrd. Flynn. Elliot and Nor­
rei watch the game . 
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350 Club Increases 
by Two 

The Bi-Centennial year proved to be a 
disappointing one for A&I's basketball 
team. The Hogs, winning only 7 of 29 
games, came in last in their conference 
race . 

Height disadvantages, internal problems 
and finally a defeated coach stepping down 
after nine long years were just some of the 
things that an A&I basketball player had to 
contend with during the trying and lonely 
voyage. 

The youthful Javelina squad had its bright 
spots during the season. James Johnson was 
named to the All-LSC Second team NAIA 
District 4, and All- District First team and a 
350 Club member. David Williams was 
named LSC Freshman of the year and also 
to the 350 Club. 

Dan Nau puts up a shot against East Texas State 
University . 

Donny Ellion pops the ball up for two points before a packed house in the Pan American University gym. 

\ 
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The A&! scoreboard lit up for the Hogs on an 85- 74 victory over Southwestern Uni­
versity . 

Dan Nau (25) and James Johnson battle off two Howard Payne Yellowjacke ts for two 
points . 

David Williams goes high for two points. 
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An Unhappy 
Season. 
but somehow. 
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. . . the experience 
was worth living 

... anyway!!! 
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Shot Putter 
Breaks 
Record 

Texas A&I had three leaders on 
the final listing of the Lone Star 
Conference top track and field 
marks of the season. They were 
John Massinggill. shot put. Jon 
Arne Nilsson. miler. and the 440-
yard relay team. 

Some of the season's best per­
formances were registered by the 
track and field team at the S. F. 
Austin Relays in Nacogdoches. 

Three A&I relay teams and one 
individual entry competed in the 
Texas Relays in Austin. The Jave­
lin as had the 440-yard. 880-yard 
and spring medley relay team 
entered and John Massingill. 

Texas A&I captured eight first 
places and amassed 176 points to 

retain its Javelinas Relays title. The Texas A&! 440-yard relay team accept gold medals for one of 
its first place performances this spring. 
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The A&! track and field team amassed 176 points to capture their own Jave lina Relays title . 

Larry Collins edged out teammate Hughie Shaw in the lOO-yard 
dash. running a record of 9.4 while Shaw had 9.5. 
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Jan- Arne Nilsson is shown leading the mile run in the Jave lina 
Relays. 

Perseverance and concentration are vital characteristics 
of a successful athlete. 

Bryan Sweeney. freshman from Belton. had a season·s best time of 15.1 in the 120-yard high hurdles. 
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Roben Garza. junior. set the record in the high jump with 6'4" . 

Massingill. 6-9 sophomore. set the school shot put record with a throw of 52 feet. 9 
in the first meet of the season . He was the top thrower in the LSC with 55 feet. 4% 
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Jan-Arne Nilsson. junior from Sweden. won the 880-yard run with the time of 1:56.4. 

John Dawson competed as a shot putter for the A&I track 
team. 
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Mike Jekel and Gary Davis were the javelin throwers for 
the track team. 

Jekel got his best javelin throw of the season in the Javelina 
Relays. with 181 feet. 10 inches. 
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Golf 
The Texas A&I golf team 

participated in four LSC meets 
which included Huntsville. 
Brownwood. Abilene. and 
Nacogdoches. 

The results of these tourna­
ments and the scores are com­
bined to determine the league 
individual and team champi­
ons. The team consisted of five 
golfers. Roger Gilcrease. Brent 
Watkins. Pat Smith. Randy 
Greebon. and Bill Edwards. 

The five members of the 
Texas A&I golf team who par­
ticipated in all of the LSC tour­
naments received their first let­
ter as a member of the Javelina 
squad. 
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Soccer 
The Texas A&I soccer team is 

a member of the Southern Con­
ference. 

Texas A&I had two represent­
atives in the Texas Collegiate 
Soccer League All-Star game in 
Houston. Mehrdad Sepehipour, 
sophomore from Iran, and Toosi 
Razavi, also a sophomore from 
Iran participated. Sepehipour 
was an offensive player for the 
A&I soccer team and Razavi was 
at a defensive position. 

When playing soccer . all use of the arms or hands is prohibited except to the 
goalkeeper. 
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The ball is propelled by kicking. or striking it with the head . shoulder. or other parts of the body 
except the arms . 
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Tennis 
The men's tennis team entered its 

first tournament of the season when 
the Javelinas participated in the Bor­
der Olympics meet in Laredo. A&I, 
which had a 2-1 season's record, 
faced some of the top teams in the 
nation. Other schools entered were 
Mary Hardin-Baylor, Rice, Pan 
American, and Galveston College. 
A&I had 5 singles and 2 doubles 
entries in the meet. The Hoggies 
owned victories over TX Lutheran 
and St. Mary's and lost to Trinity 
University. 

The Javelinas had 4 singles and 2 
doubles entries in the 2-day meet at 
the Schreiner invitational tourna ­
ment in Kerrville. Furlow and 
Adams along with Meyers and Bruce 
ga ve the team their doubles entry. 

Sterling Adams, senior, went 3-0 
in matches against East Texas, Trin­
ity, and Southwestern Adams and 
Furlow had a 7 -4 record in doubles, 
best on the team. Ricky Bruce and 
Jay Meyers were named to the All­
Lone Star Conference tennis team for 
the second consecutive season. They 
defeated the top doubles team from 
East Texas State and Angelo State. 

John Furlow, junior from Premont, will be receiving his second letter with 
the team. 
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Sterling Adams. junior from Corpus Christi King. received 
his initial letter . 

Ricky Bruce and Jay Meyers. were runnerups in the Lone Star Conference doubles tournament 
in Nacogdoches. 
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Women's Tennis 
The Texas A&I...,University women's tennis team hosted Texas Southmost in its first dual match of the 

season. 
The Iavelinas also participated in the Lamar State tournament, Texas Southmost invitational tourna­

ment. 
Yolanda Garza a member of the Texas A&l women's tennis team won the singles consolation champion­

ship at the University of Texas tournament. Kathy Garza and Yolanda Garza represented Texas A&l Uni­
versity in the TAlA W state tennis tournament in San Marcos. 
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Women's 
Basketball 
The A&I women's basketball 

team entered the TAlA W State 
Tournament for the 8th consec­
uti ve season in Nacogdoches. 
The team qualified for the state 
event by finishing second in the 
South Zone tournament in 
Kingsville. Four of the players 
are sophomores and the remain­
ing six are rookies, giving the 
Hoggies one of the youngest 
alignments in their 8 years of 
intercollegiate competition. 

The first-year players are 
Cherry Harmon, Cindy Wil­
liamson and Bonnie Saenz. The 
sophomores are Rosalinda 
Perez, Nora William, Beverly 
Junker, and Sandra Jimenez. 
All but Jimenez were members 
of the 1975 team, however she 
became the leading scorer for 
the team averaging over 20 pts. 
a game. 
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Sandra Jimenez. sophomore from Victoria Stroman. was the leading scorer for the Texas A&I basketball team this season. 
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Women's 
Volleyball 

Esther Pena from Mission was the subject of great conuoversy this spring. 
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Women's 
Softball 
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FRONT ROW: Leonard Sra lla . Aime Bohn. George Cerrillo. Luis Rodriquez. Karen Wheeler. Susan Manin. Rita Hoe lscher . Shir­
ley Hammack. Bill Bronstel. Mike Dougherty. Jose T. Garcia. Juan M. Vargas. ROW 2: Doyle W. Cuniss. Victor M. Ramirez. 
James P. Jungmann. Rosario S. Garcia. Barbara Mueller. Carrie McGuire. Joe Pina. George L. Martinez. Jesusa Sanchez. 
Oralia Trevino. ROW 3: Butch Roeckev. Herbert Power. Eugene Petru. Phil Monroe. Virgil Stone. Garry R. Meador. J. Rolando 
Gonzalez . Justo Ybarra JI. • Robert Hudman. Robin E. Holmes. Scott Sampsell. Steven Drawe . Douglas Palzer. Ken Martin. 

Accounting 
Society 

The purpose of the Texas A&I 
Accounting Society is to further 
the interest and understanding 
of accountancy among its mem­
bers and to promote a more cor­
dial relationship among prac­
ticing accountants. accounting 
instructors and their students. 

This year the club sponsored a 
free tax clinic for low income 
families. 

To join. one must be an 
accounting major who is either 
taking or has completed ele­
mentary accounting. 

The Accounting Society 
scholarship was awarded to Rob­
ert Hudman. 

FRONT ROW: Rosario S. Garcia. secretary; Barbara Muelle r. preside nt . ROW 2: 
Ken Martin. sponsor; Ed O'Donnell, treasure r; Douglas Palzer. vice-president. 
ROW 3: Leonard Sralla. reporter ; Robert Hudman. parliamentarian. 
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FRONT ROW: Paul Lee Casares, song le ader ; Dr. David Crenshaw, sponsor ; Nancy 
McCarty, sweetheart; Dr. Darroll Grant, sponsor. ROW 2: Jeff Bowman, treasurer ; 
Howard Duge, parliamentarian; Mark Sugarek, reporter. ROW 3: Jerry Lewis , sec ­
re t ary; Ke nneth Schaefer, vice -presid e nt ; John Rotramel, pitc hfork wielder; 
Michael Wiede, president. 

Aggie Club 
The primary aims of the 

Aggie Club of the Texas A&I 
College of Arts and Sciences are 
to promote social friendship of 
campus agriculture students and 
professional improvement. 

A Halloween Dance was held 
to raise money for the club 's 
trip to the San Antonio livestock 
show and rodeo in February. 

The 20-member club also 
held the Aggie Roundup at Mes­
quite Grove in the spring to 

raise money for the Aggie of the 
Year scholarship fund and to 
provide a free barbecue supper 
for the children from Youth 
City. 

FRONT ROW: Frank Stewart, Kenneth Schaefer, Paul Lee Casares, Cyndi Schultz, Karen Wheeler, Francis Moltz , Pattie Wal­
lace , Jerry Le wis , Miche lle De Hart, Jane Stevenson, Dr. Darroll Grant, sponsor. ROW 2: Jimmy Ross, Jerome Moy, Jorge A. 
Gonzalez, Samue l Garcia, Rogelio Gonzalez, Mark Sugarek, Eddy Salles , Larry Vecchi, Larry Mokry, Jeff Bowman, Stephanie 
Hucker, Dr. David Crenshaw, Beth Jenkins. ROW 3: Hal Tom, Bill Tillman, Michae l Wiede, Robert Perez Jr., Lino Requenez, 
David R. Ramirez , Richard Brunner, Howard Duge, Garry Jordan, Greg Schreiber, Ray Meyer, Nelda Moore, Nancy McCarty, 
Deena Soudil, John W. Rotrame l . 
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FRONT ROW: Eldon Glynn Williams Jr.. Roberto Noe Trevino. Mark Mullinix. Karen Renee Nielsen. Candy Kayne McPherson. 
Mickey Wayne Shaw. Vinod Chudgar. Carl Bird. ROW 2: Mortez Dastgheib. Allen Bues. Bill Gillespie. Paul Dannels. L. N. 
Johnson (advisor) . Ghazi A. Zughni. James R. McDonald. Mark A . May . Gary E. Hoke. Gustavo Alvarado. 

AIME 
The Society of Petroleum 

Engine e rs of the American 
Institute of Mining Metallurgi­
cal and Petroleum Engineers is 
open to any student in good 
standing who is carrying two­
thirds full time load of engi­
neering curriculum. 

The 40-member organization 
tries to promote the petroleum 
engineering profession and 
keeps its members abreast of the 
latest technological methods of 
the petroleum industry. 

The club also viewed films 
about life around offshore plat­
forms. construction of offshore 
facilities and production equip­
ment in Alaska. 

FRONT ROW: Mark Mullinix. vice-president; Paul Dannels. treasurer; Mickey 
Wayne Shaw. reporter. ROW 2: Bill Gillespie . president; L. N. Johnson. advisor; 
Eldon Glynn Williams Jr .. secretary. 
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engineering profession and 
keeps its members abreast of the 
latest technological methods of 
the petroleum industry. 

The club also viewed films 
about life around offshore plat­
forms, construction of offshore 
facilities and production equip­
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FRONT ROW: Mark Mullinix. vice-president; Paul Dannels. treasurer; Mickey 
Wayne Shaw. reporte r. ROW 2: Bill Gillespie . president; L. N. Johnson. advisor; 
Eldon Glynn Williams Jr .• secretary. 



OFFICERS: Ernest A . Franke. advisor; Mae Dell Schiller. advisor; Carl C. Cannon. 
president; Susie Wyatt . secre tary-treasurer; Dr. George A. Cook. advisor. 

Alpha Chi 
Alpha Chi Honorary Society is 

a coeducational society whose 
purpose is to promote academic 
excellence and exemplary 
character among college and 
university students and honor 
them for such achievements. 

The 75- member chapter, 
which requires members to be of 
junior or senior standing with at 
least a 3.5 G.P.A., supports 
the motto that "Ye shall know 
the truth and the truth shall 
make you free .. , 

Carl Cannon was the recipient 
of the chapter's $50 scholarship 
which is awarded each year to a 
deserving second-year member. 

FRONT ROW: Lilly Flores . Patricia Hayes . Becky Williams. Sarah Turk. ROW 2: Jack C. Damron. Del Rhea King. Susie Wyatt. 
George A. Cook. advisor. 
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FRONT ROW: Imelda Sa las. Lina Vela. Renee Michalk. Bette Poeske. Mary Jo Oberg. Carla Michalk. Bessie Anderson. ROW 2: 
Rosaena Perez. Carol Bishop. Patricia Hayes . Lilia Flores . Oralia Rodriquez. Sylvia Barrera. Leticia Turullols . ROW 3: Jimmie 
R. Picquet (advisor). Lupe Gracia. Gloria Vela. Dora Salinas. De l Rhea King. Rosario S. Garcia. Debbie Borden. Cassie Fla­
gie lla (advisor) . 

Alpha Lambda 
Delta 

A pledge dinner and formal 
initiation were among the high­
lights of the year for Alpha 
Lambda Delta. 

The 40-member sorority pro­
motes intelligent living and 
high standards of learning and 
encourages superior scholastic 
attainment among women in 
their first year at this college. 

Alpha Lambda Delta evolved 
in 1967 from the Texas A&I 
University Freshmen Women's 
Honor Society and has since ini­
tiated girls of high schoiastic 
achievements. 

Membership is limited to 
females enrolled for at least 12 
hours and has completed at least 
15 hours and not more than 30 
with a G.P.A. of 3.5. 

FRONT ROW: Imelda Salas. president; Patricia Hayes. senior advisor; Debbie Bor­
den. treasurer. ROW 2: Rosaena Perez. historian ; Lina Vela. vice-president; Renee 
Michalk . reponer; Oralia Rodriquez. secretary . 
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FIRST ROW : Robert Hoeber. President ; Dolores Hoeber. SECOND ROW: Robert 
Anderson. Bob Merritt. Leonard Sralla. Vice President ; Chip Hoyt. Secretary. 

Alpha Phi 
Omega 

The Alpha Phi Omega 
National Service Fraternity 
exists for the purpose of serving 
the campus, the community and 
the country. 

Basing its ideals on those of 
the Boy Scouts of America, the 
organiza tion is open to anyone 
who wants to be of service. 

The fraternity's main recipi­
ent of its money raising projects 
is the Heart Fund. APO's around 
the state compete in raising 
money for this cause. 

The APO's usually do the 
campus elections and sponsor a 
Navajo Indian orphan. 

Members also sell advertise­
ments for desk blotters which 
they distribute free to students. 
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FRONT ROW : Rudy Flores. Paul Lee Casares. Jerome Moy. Jeff Bowman. Louis Rothe. r. Jj. Wines \aUV1SOIj. KVW ,,, nowara 
Duge. Hal Tom. Richard Brunner. Dr. David Crenshaw (advisor), Jack Bryan. David Garza. ROW 3: Leo Bailey (advisor). Roy 
Hernandez. Jerry Lewis. Kenneth Schaefer. Johnny Moffett. Michael Wiede. 

Alpha Tau 
Alpha 

The Mu Chapter of Alpha Tau 
Alpha at Texas A&I was 
installed in 1937. 

The 15-member organization 
strives to promote the highest 
ideals and standards of agricul­
tural education and a more inti­
mate acquaintance and rela­
tionship among individuals who 
have chosen the profession of 
teaching agriculture. 

The chapter is open to agri­
culture majors with at least 30 
hours and a 2.5 G.P.A. 

Advisors for the group are F. 
W. Wines and David Crenshaw. 

FRONT ROW: Jerome Moy. president; Louis Rothe. secretary. ROW 2: Dennis Neu­
man. vice-president; Richard Brunner. reporter. 
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FRONT ROW: The lma Garza . secretary; Steve Kanter. president ; Belinda 1. Espi­
noza. treasure r. ROW 2: Dr. M. Olivares . advisor ; Jim Presley . reporter ; Dr. Jo A . 
Beran. advisor. 

Chemical 
Society 

The Texas A&I University 
Student Affiliate of the Ameri­
can Che mical Society was 
established in 1973 . 

Electrophonic separation of 
proteins and the chemistry of 
vision were among the topics 
covered by the chapter's guest 
speakers. 

The club's 25 members sell 
lab coats and goggles to raise 
money for these speakers. 

James Remlinger received the 
1975 Undergraduate Award in 
Anal ytical Chemistry. 

FRONT ROW: Nora Rodriquez . Blanca A. Bocanegra. The lma Garza . Sandra Sampley . Belinda 1. Espinoza. ROW 2: Tim Harts­
fie ld. Steve Kamer. Jim Presley. Celie Ruhnke. Michael Ha nus. Romualdo Garza . Wayne Williams. ROW 3: Dr. Alberto M . 
Olivares (advisor) . Bill Poole (graduate assistant) . Carl Cannon. Clayton Hammock . Richard West. Chris Eicher. Martin Fisher. 
Jo A . Beran. 
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FRONT ROW: Bill Tschoemer. Jose E. Morales. Felix Zapata. Juan J. Saavedra. Sompol Pata malai. Oscar Diaz . ROW 2: Duane 
Hallemann . Glen Taylor. James Fealy. Mickel P . McKinney . Jose "Mando" Garza. Robert E. Richter. Farhad Abar. Romula 
Jeor . ROW 3: Dr. M. M. Truitt. Stuart Franke. Stanley Pavlos . Raymond D. Lay. Vance Meischen. Billy Drawe. Hilmar A. 
Koch. Gerardo H. Garcia. Abel de Leon . 

ASCE 
The student chapter of the 

American Society of Civil 
Engineers strives to help the stu­
dent prepare himself for entry 
into the Civil Engineering pro­
fession and society. 

The l8-member chapter held 
its first annual beer keg dona­
tion in order to raise money for 
a traffic survey for Kingsville. 

A guest speaker from Optical 
Systems Research Inc. spoke to 
the group on electronic distance 
measuring devices. 

ASCE sponsors a parent and 
student chapter banquet each 
spring in order to acquaint the 
parent chapter and engineers 
from the local firms with the 
students. 

FRONT ROW : Duane Hallemann. secretary; Bill Tschoerner. president. ROW 2: 
Stuart Franke. vice-president; Raymond D. Lay. treasurer. 
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ASCE 
The student chapter of the 

American Society of Civil 
Engineers strives to help the stu­
dent prepare himself for entry 
into the Civil Engineering pro­
fession and society. 

The 18-member chapter held 
its first annual beer keg dona­
tion in order to raise money for 
a traffic survey for Kingsville. 

A guest speaker from Optical 
Systems Research Inc. spoke to 
the group on electronic distance 
measuring devices. 

ASCE sponsors a parent and 
student chapter banquet each 
spring in order to acquaint the 
parent chapter and engineers 
from the local firms with the 
students. 

FRONT ROW: Duane Halle mann . secretary; Bill Tschoerner. president. ROW 2: 
Stuart Franke. vice -president; Raymond D. Lay. treasurer. 



OFFICERS: Rodney Henckel. vice-president; John V. Simon. chairman; John 
Wheeler. treasurer. 

ASME 
The A&I Student Section of 

the American Society of 
Mechanical Engineers is geared 
for the advancement of knowl­
edge of theory and practice of 
mechanical engineering. 

The 27-member club also 
works toward the presentation of 
a proper perspective of engi­
neering work and the opportu­
nity to become acquainted with 
the personnel and activities of 
the society itself. 

Apollo Flights, Metal Form:.. 
ing rubber manufacturing were 
among the topics covered by 
films the members viewed. 

Members sold engineers' 
green hats during engineering 
week to raise money for 
regional trips. 

FRONT ROW : Fahir Basci (advisor). Jose Antonio Ramos. ROW 2: Joe R. Moreno. Rodney Henckel . Michael J. Bailey. ROW 3: 
Ovidio Bustillos. Larry Tschirhart. Abel Joel Yzaguirre. Hedayat Hassanzadeh. Mark Heatherly. Mark Frels . ROW 4: Clifford 
Lee Redus. H. B. Fisher. John V. Simon. John Wheeler . James Fealy . 
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FRONT ROW: Janet Wood, Wanda Conditt, Ana Maria Somma, Bonnie Timlin, Linda Sexton, Karen E. Seiffert, Inettia Jo 
Hector, Sarita Gardner, Sarah Baker, Stacy Woolsey, Lou Ann St. Clair, Keith Pollock, Glenann King, Elizabeth Qualls, Cindy 
Light, Gayle Franklin. ROW 2: Rosie Cruz, Dona ld Gebhart, Lisa Davis, Linda Bryan, Mary Ann Williams, Del Rhea King, 
Dorothy DeSpain, Pam Duniver , Wiley Jo Ray, Theresa Madden, Michael D. Brown, Linda Pesquera, Hugo H . Martinez, Randy 
B. Jackson, Donna Powell, Brent Fe lde r , Bruce Peterson (dirC'ctor). ROW 3: Sylvia Villegas, Walter Gillett, Donald Frye, Curtis 
Sullivan, Carrie Cole, Carl DeLa Garza, Randolph K . Claus, Ronald Neitzke, Phil Edgar, Roger Watson, Lee Bevly, Barry 
Dunn, Raymond L. Johnson, Terry McCown, Terry Wilkinson, Robert Hardie, Roger Rodriguez, Roland Bazan, Michael Field­
ing . 

BSU 
The 200-member Baptist Stu­

dent Union tries to give every­
one on the A&I campus the 
opportunity to say "yes" to 
Jesus Christ and assists Chris­
tians in spiritual maturation. 

Noon luncheons are sponsored 
by the club every Wednesday to 

raise money for the Summer 
Missions Program which help 
support students of Texas to go 
around the world to serve 
Christ. 

The BSU took up money to 
help with the world hunger 
drive. The money was sent 
directly to Bangledash to help 
with fish farming. tools and 
food. 

FRONT ROW: Pam Dunive r , president; Cindy Light, Bible study chairman; Sarita 
Gardner, publicity; Rosie Cruz , noon luncheons; Wanda Conditt, evangelism coor­
dinator. ROW 2: Karen Seiffert, fine arts; Mary Ann Williams , enlistment; Keith 
Pollock, church re lations; Donna Powell, vice-president; Gayle Franklin, pro­
grams. ROW 3: Bruce Pete rson, director; Donald Gebhart, missions; Terry 
McCown, intramurals; Terry Wilkinson, discipleship. 
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FRONT ROW : Walter Mebane. vice -president; Ana Maria Somma. reporter; Joe 
Martin. secretary. ROW 2: Steven Kanter. parliamentarian; Richard Schmidt. trea­
surer; John Karges. president . 

Biology Club 
Anyone interested in any 

phase of the biological sciences 
is welcome to join the Biology 
Club of Texas A&I University. 

Promoting further interest in 
the field of biology is the main 
purpose of the club which boasts 
45 members. 

The annual Wildlife Show 
sponsored by the club helps fund 
trips, scholarships, parties and 
equipment for the group. 

Club members may compete 
for a Biology Scholarship which 
is a warded to an outstanding 
individual. 

FRONT ROW: Leticia Turullols. Edna Mae Escobar. Thelma Garza. Dinah Hall. Helen Arizmendi. Oralia Rodriquez. Maria 
Villagomez. Maria Reyes. Leo Juarez. ROW 2: David Corley. Hector Kifuri Rodriguez. Steven Kanter. Ana Maria Somma. 
Sharon Scale. Karen Reese. Joe Martin. Vivian Garcia. ROW 3: R. H. McCoy. Richard R. Schmidt. Mauro L. Pena, Sharon 
Bridges. Carl Cannon. John Karges. Walter Mebane. Gene Fields. Eli Villarreal. Eduardo Cantu. A. H. Chaney. 
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170 

FRONT ROW : Frances 10 Plocek. Nitin Shah. Surati Rajendrakumar. Shah Mahesh. Cuong Ta Nguyen . ROW 2: N. N. Bhat. 
Chris 1. Eicher. B. N. Avlani. F. Nasseri Pebdani. ROW 3: Tim Hartsfie ld. Michael Hanus. Richard West. Dr. K. C. Ooste rh­
out (advisor). 

Chemical 
Engineers 

The Campus Society of 
Chemical Engineers serves to 
promote the professional devel­
opment of its members by its 
programs and relations with 
other engineering organiza­
tions. 

It also strives to contribute to 
the development of chemical 
engineering at A&I through 
activities involving the faculty 
and student members. 

The 3D-member club sponsors 
field trips to area chemical and 
petroleum plants and activities 
at the fall carnival such as a 
dance or the "bucking barrel. " 

OFFICERS : Frances 10 Plocek. vice-president; Dr. K . C. Oosterhout. advisor; Rich­
ard West. treasurer; Chris 1. Eicher. secretary. 
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FRONT RO W: Francisco D. Lopez-Herrera. sponsor; George Zarate. president; Ofe­
lia Cisneros. treasurer ; Rev . Anthony Moran. chaplain. ROW 2: Gloria Vela. sec ­
re tary; Christy Gonzalez. publicity chairman; Lina Vela. vice -president. 

Catholic 
Student Club 
The Catholic Student Club 

promotes religious. spiritual. 
social and educational meth­
ods. 

Among the club's special 
activities were a Big Brother and 
Big Sister project. visits to 
Youth City. retreats and partic­
ipation in a multiple sclerosis 
drive. 

A volleyball tournament for 
all the Bible Chairs on camplis 
was sponsored by the club with 
trophies and ribbons being 
awarded. 

Car washes. bake sales and 
dances were conducted to raise 
money to help people on 
retreat. to provide refreshments 
after mass each Sunday and to 
support the University Catholic 
Center. 

FRONT ROW: Rosa Revilla. Ophelia Morales. George Zarate. Ofilia Cisneros. Christy Gonzalez . Gracie Uribe. Diamantina 
Gonzales . ROW 2: Francisco D. Lopez -Herrera. Gloria Vela. Carol Garza. Noemi Garza. Lina Vela. Andy Rodriquez . Janie 
Anabel Salazar. Rev. Anthony Moran. ROW 3: Rey Flores. Victor D. Gunnoe. Albert Trevino. Charles Compton. Martin Cas­
tillo. Alfredo Garcia . 
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172 

FRONT ROW: Dr. Louis Thurston (advisor) . Orlando Rosas. Laveo S . Charles. Delfino Cerri llo . ROW 2: Dr. W. W. Wallace 
(advisor) . Roben C . Anderson . Justo Ybarro Jr . • Jack Hardy (advisor). Bruce A. Payne. 

Chess Club 
The Unive rsity Chess Club 

which was organized in 1972 
opens its membership to every­
one . 

Among the various chess tour­
naments entered by the club's 
members were the South Texas 
Open Championship, the Jave ­
lina Open, a match with Corpus 
Christi, the A&I championship 
and various 10-second tourna­
ments. 

Many exhibitions and activi­
ties were initiated by the club's 
president and reigning 10-sec­
ond champion, Justo Ybarra. 

In 10-se cond chess, each 
pIa yer has exactly 10 seconds 
for each move. 

FRONT ROW: Orla ndo Rosas . treasurer; Delfino Cerrillo . vice -president . ROW 2: 
Justo Ybarra Jr.. president; Bruce A. Payne . corresponding se cre tary and tourna­
ment direc tor . 
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Many exhibitions and activi­
ties were initiated by the club's 
president and reigning 10-sec­
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ment director. 



FRONT ROW : Melinda Horez. historian; Noemi Ruth Perez. president and warden. 
ROW 2: Cathy Williams. first vice-president; Rose Rodriguez. director of publicity; 
Carol Brown. treasurer. 

Delta 
Omicron 

Delta Omicron is a music 
service fraternity which oper­
ates under the motto "Continu­
ally Striving We Attain." 

Membership is open to music 
majors or minors with a 2.25 
overall average and a 3.0 music 
average. 

The group ushers at commu­
nity concerts and music depart­
ment functions. They also 
teach music at St. Gertrude's . . 

Selling food to visiting band 
members is one of the chapter's 
money raising projects. The 
money is used for chapter 
expenses and to provide for the 
coffee they serve at various 
recitals. 

FRONT ROW : Christy Sugars. Deana Voges. ROW 2: Noemi Ruth Perez. Mr. Mark Stupp (beau). Melinda Horez. ROW 3: Margie 
Beltran. Cathy Williams. Carol Brown. Rose Rodriguez. 
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174 

FRONT ROW: D. E. Todds. Walter Byrne. Hari Patel. Don Herring. Roberto Garcia Jr .• David G. Ford. ROW 2: Kenneth Row­
land . Don Carden. Alan McCulley. Kenneth Riley. James O. Rose. Mike Smith. 

Eta Kappa 
Nu 

Eta Kappa Nu is an electrical 
engineering honor society whose 
purpose is to bring together top 
electrical engineering students 
so that by their fellowship they 
can improve themselves. their 
school. and be better equipped 
for the world ahead. 

To be eligible for member­
ship one must be either a junior 
electrical engineering student 
in the top one-third of the class 
or a senior in the top one-fourth 
of the electrical engineering 
class. 

This cam pus' cha pter is 
known as Zeta Beta and has a 
slide show and recording to show 
to prospective members. 

OFFICERS: Don Carden. vice-president; Kenneth Riley. president; David Ford. 
recording secretary; James Rose. secretary-treasurer. 
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ALPHA PSI OMEGA MEMBERS: John Michael Vega . Michael Boyd. Luis Munoz 
(grand director) . Danny Reyes . Taylor Cage (stage manager). 

Footlites, 
Alpha Psi 

Omega 
The Footlites Club. which is 

open to anyone with an interest 
in drama. strives to promote 
theatrical activity. 

Alpha Psi Omega is an honor­
ary dramatic fraternity which 
requires 100 points for member­
ship. each point representing 
eight hours of work backstage. 

Footlites claims the honor of 
being the oldest existing club on 
campus while Alpha Psi Omega 
was formed in 1955. 

The two clubs raise money for 
their annual banquet by sponsor­
ing the Alpha Psi-Footlites Club 
Show which for 1976 included 
.• A Funny Thing Happened on 
the Way to the Forum." 

FOOTLITES MEMBERS: FRONT ROW : Anna Maria Vega. John Michae l Vega. ROW 2: Mike Boyd. Yvonne Villarreal. Luis 
Munoz. Edna E. Esquiveh. Dan Brady. John Connor. Rachel Lerral . Tom Stephens. ROW 3: Adan Uresti. Danny Reyes . Gilbert 
Zepeda. Kerry Carruth. Taylor Cage. Jerry Salazar. Jose Rodriguez. Julie Baker. Jo Anna Butler. Eli Garza. 
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176 

FRONT ROW: J. Rodney Anderson. Marvin L. Nash. Daniel H. Brubaker. Albert Ludwig. Rickey Neill. 1. B. Wines (advisor) . 
ROW 2: Lee Bailey (advisor). Robert Perez Jr .• Rudy Flores . Je rome Moy. Louis Rothe. Susan Bourne. Lino Requenez. Gerald 
Mick. ROW 3: Silveria Perez . Baldemar Garza Jr.. John W. Rotramel. Jack Bryan. Joe Jones. David Garza. Nelda Moore. Raul 
M. Hinojosa. ROW 4: Jorge A. Gonzalez. Rey Hernandez. Richard Brunner. Richard Dobie. John A. Bradley. Steve Dollery. 
Linl Beceara. Steven Huddleston. Nancy McCarty. John Knolls. 

FFA 
The Collegiate Chapter of 

Future Farmers of America is 
open to agriculture education 
majors or former members of 
FF A in high school. 

The club's motto is Learning 
to Do, Doing to Learn, Earning 
to Live, Living to Serve. 

The purpose of the 3D-mem­
ber chapter is to practice broth­
erhood, honor rural opportuni­
ties and responsibilities, and 
develop those qualities of lead­
ership which a Future Farmer 
should possess. 

The FFA chapter also sponsors 
the Area X FFA Leadership and 
Judging Contest each year. 

FRONT ROW: Rey Hernandez. president; Albert Ludwig. reporter; David Garza. 
sentinel. ROW 2: Richard Brunner. secretary; John Rotramel. treasurer; Jack Bryon. 
vice-president. 
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Dudley G. Martin. Reporter; James Ellison. Vice President; Laura Bajaza . Secre ­
tary; Lee Powell. President; Fermin Munoz. Jr .• Reporter. 

Geology Club 
"Fault not. Want not" is the 
motto of the Texas A&I Geolog­
ical Society . 

The club. which welcomes 
anyone with an interest in geol­
ogy . attempts to acquaint the 
m e mbe rs with the various 
aspects of geology and to share 
knowledge and experience with 
other people and institutions. 

Mexico and Alpine were 
among the stops of the club's 
field trips along with various 
one day trips to Laredo. Padre 
and Site 55 at Rivera . 

Slide presentations viewed by 
the members focused on trips 
made by guests to the Grand 
Canyon. Colorado and New 
Mexico. 

FRONT ROW: Gilberto Guerra. Susan Barnes. Donald Orr . Joyce Menchaca. Leone Saavedra. ROW 2: Dudle y G. Martin. Mike 
Russe l, Dick Jackson . Hank Burrow. Philip Rodriquez . ROW 3: Dr. Raymond Suhm. James Ellison . Laura Bajza. Fermin Munoz. 
Jr .• Lee Powell . 
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178 

FRONT ROW : Gloria Leal. Carrie McGuire. Susan Martin. Noralina Perez. Blanca Bocanegra. ROW 2: Cindy Nanny. Pam 
Tuma. Carol Bishop. Judy Mechler . Minnie Elizondo . ROW 3: Vicki Bast. Mary Thompson. Jovita Rodriguez. Loretta Bast . Rita 
Stuchly. 

Gold Jackets 
Gold Jackets is a service 

sorority which was started in 
1962 for the purpose of serving 
the University. 

Since that time they have 
helped with every homecom­
ing, Parents' Day, Band Day 
and the multiple sclerosis 
drive. 

Members have also visited 
nursing homes and Youth City 
and in the past have acted as 
the official "hostess" for the 
President in the president's box 
Cor each home game. 

In addition the members have 
hel ped with the English, Math 
and German conferences. 

Membership is open to any 
female student with a 2.25 or 
higher G.P.A. 

OFFICERS: Susan Martin. reporter; Rita Stuchly. secretary-treasurer; Jovita Rodri­
guez. vice-president; Loretta Bast. president. 
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FRONT ROW: Johnny Maninez. president; Many Galaviz. treasurer. ROW 2: Ed 
Gorny. vice-president; Mark Littleton. men's intramural director; Molly Ruiz. 
women's intramural director; Stewart Cooper. sponsor . 

HPE 
The Health and Physical Edu­

cation (HPE) Club is open to any 
HPE major, boy or girl. 

The club is geared to instill 
an interest in and around all 
phases of physical education. 

The two main fund raising 
projects of this club are selling 
cokes at the UIL track meet 
here each spring and also at the 
UIL basketball meet. 

The money is used partly for 
setting up a scholarship for an 
upper level HPE major. The rest· 
is used for various socials for the 
members. 

Some of the regular club 
activities include a Christmas 
party, a trip to Padre and an 
end of the year banquet. 

FRONT ROW: Delma Elizondo. Lydia Hernandez. Patricia Hayes. Ruby Sandoval. Gina Trevino. Pat Whitney. Cindy Goznalez. 
Diana Ramos. Marty Galaviz. ROW 2: Janie S. Saenz. Conchi Hernandez. Maria Elena Shears. Carolyn Taylor. Johnny G. 
Martinez, Mark Littleton. Debbie Russell. Beverly Junker. Vickey Perez. ROW 3: Joyce Tegeler. Victor M. Morales. Stewart 
Cooper. Ed Gorny. Jack C. Damron. Joe R. Trevino. Osvaldo Hernandez. Jr.. Molly Ruiz. Mary Behal. 
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FRONT ROW : Stanley Bittinger (advisor). Helen Delgado. Susie Davila. Norma Nelda Alvarez . Yolanda F. Alvarado. Mary 
Conez. Anita Camarillo. ROW 2: Delfino Cerrillo. Orlando Rosas. Erlinda Castillo. George Cerrillo. Cynda Tobin. Maria 
Rosario Garcia. Mana Hernandez. Irma Teran. Maria Teresa Mata. ROW 3: George Castillo. Jose Tamez . Eduardo L. Villalon. 
Sylvia Flores. Emma Escobar. Susie Gutierrez. Ruth Gonzalez. Annabelle Tudon. Dr. Juan Sauvageau (advisor). 

Hispano Club 
Club Hispanoamericano is a 

social and scholastic organiza­
tion for the promotion of the 
Spanish American culture. 

It promotes and encourages a 
better relationship between the 
American countries as well as 
practicing the Spanish Language 
and promoting the Spanish cul­
ture through direct participa­
tion. 

A trip to Mexico City for the 
New Year was one of the club's 
highlights of the year. 

Car washes. selling candy, 
dances and beer busts are among 
the organization's money rais­
ing projects. 

FRONT ROW: Norma Alvarez. president; Ruth Gonzalez. treasurer; Mary Conez. 
secretary. ROW 2: George Cerrillo. vice-president; Dr. Juan Sauvageau. sponsor; 
Stanley Bittinger. sponsor. 
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FRONT ROW : Roberta Griffen. president; Ricki L. Smith . historian; Mary Lozano. 
secretary. ROW 2: Rosario Garza. re porter; Harriet Jackson. first vice-president; 
Jeannie Theiss. second vice- president ; Maria Elena Rodriguez. treasurer; Debbie 
Stoltzfus. social chairman . 

Home 
Economics 

The Texas A&I Chapter of the 
Texas Home Economics Student 
Section opens its membership to 
anyone enrolled in or interested 
in Home Economics (male or 
female). 

Members heard speakers cov­
ering such topics as cosmetics, 
gift wrapping, and hair care and 
styling. Also a film on interior 
decorating was shown. 

For the first year the club 
presented a "H. E. Member of 
the Year A ward" to a member 
of the club who obtained the 
most points through a merit sys­
tem. 

Bake sales and booths in the 
Fall carnival are two of the 
club's fund raising projects that 
help to pay part of the mem­
bers'dues. 

FRONT ROW : Doris Gaines. Carmen Chapa. Noemi Garza. Sylvia Rodriguez . Maria R. Guille n. Ricki L. Smith. ROW 2: 
Annette Shoquist. Raquel Gonzalez. Dolores E. Longoria. Anna Laura Mendoza. Roberta Griffin. Mary A. Lozano. Maria Elena 
Rodriguez . ROW 3: Rosario Garza. Harriet Jackson. Jeannie Theiss. Debbie Stoltzfus. Theresa Bluntzer. Dolores Weynand. 
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FRONT ROW: J. Rodney Anderson. Susie Swetlick. Louis Roche. Susan Cocozza. Ricky Neill. Leonora Martin. Roberta Griffin. 
ROW 2: Jerome Moy. Paul Lee Casares. Judy Lynn Havelka. Albert Ludwig. Laura Jernigan. Susan Bourne. Carol Bishop. Ste­
phanie Haecker. Lee Ann Kreuz. Leo Bailey (advisor). ROW 3: Jorge A. Gonzalez. David R. Ramirez. Kenneth Karnei. Jeff 
Bowman. Cyndi Schultz. Karen Wheeler. Hilmar A. Koch. Theresa Bluntzer. Robert Rieder. Margaret Bluntzer. Hans Horda. 
ROW 4: Michael Wiede. William B. Dear. Jerry Lewis. Jimmy Ross. Howard Duge. Dennis Neuman. Gerald Mick. James 
Ruschhaupt. Kenneth Schaefer. John W. Rotramel. Mike Terrell. 

Horticulture 
The Texas A&I Horticulture 

Club had 45 members this year. 
Membership is open to anyone 

with an interest in horticulture. 
Slides of landscaped homes 

and businesses were presented at 
some of the meetings. 

The Plant Sales in the fall 
and spring constitute the main 
money-making drive for the 
organiza tion. 

One of the special projects of 
this group is to help horticulture 
majors find jobs. 

Dr . and Mrs. Leo Bailey and 
Mr. and Mrs. Durwood Thomp­
son are the club's sponsors. 

FRONT ROW: Louis Roche. president; Susie Swetlick. secretary-treasurer. ROW 2: 
Rickey Neill. reporter; Dennis Neuman. vice-president. 
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FRONT ROW: N. K. Vaghela. executive committee member; H. N. Darn. faculty; 
Janak C . Trivedi, president. ROW 2: Hemant Bhatt. executive committee mem­
ber; Satish Naik. secretary. ROW 3: Pratap Reddy. vice-president; Murali Mohan. 
executive committee member; Subhash Chander. treasurer. 

India 
Students 

The India Student Association 
promotes social and cultural 
activities of interest to Indian 
students and American people. 

The 38-member organization 
invi tes anyone interested in 
1. S. A. activities to join. 

Diwali Night, the celebration 
of the Hindu New Year, is 
marked with activities by the 
group in November. 

Members also have a party at 
the end of each semester to 
honor graduating students. 

Several Indian movies are 
shown throughout the year such 
as "Professor Aavishrar," "Dil 
Dolat Duniya" and 
. • Sharmiler .•• 

FRONT ROW: Hari Patel. Dr. Hari Darn (faculty). Janak Trivedi. ROW 2: Joginder S. Gupta. Nitin Shah. Rajendrakumar C. 
Surati. Mahesh Shah . N. K. Vaghela. Hemant Bhatt. Satish Naik. Shaizad A. Chatriwala. Hamendra K. Doshi. ROW 3: Shyam 
B. Mehta. Vinod Chudgar. A . Jagan Mohan. B. N. Avlani. G . Balakrishmarao. Amulakh B. Naik. Bakul P . Patel. Dinanath 
Gharmalker. ROW 4: Prabhat Sur. Pratap Reddy. Rajani Shah. Murali Mohan. Subhash Chander. Krishnamurthy Jayaram. Sho­
yeh T. Hasanali. 
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~84 

FRONT ROW : Mary Tom. Sixto R. Alvarez. Jose A. Sa ldivar . Ricardo D. Garza . Herschel G . Kelley (advisor) . ROW 2: Je rry 
Hedrick (advisor) . Vladimir Medina . He liodoro Cantu Jr.. Conrad K. Reilly . ROW 3: Randy Thompson . Lottie Norwine . Flem­
ing McMurray. Fe lix Cruz . Dudley G. Martin . 

Industrial 
Arts Club 

The Texas A&I Industrial Arts 
Club strives to further and foster 
the aims and objectives of 
Industrial Arts and to provide a 
social stimulus for students with 
an interest in I. A . 

Membership is open to under­
graduates majoring in Industrial 
Arts. 

One of the group 's projects 
included landscaping the lawn 
around the I. A. building by 
planting shrubs and flowers. 

Members also participated in 
the Student Development Hal­
loween Carnival, held barbe­
cues and made plaques and 
name plates for various organi­
zations. 

OFFICERS: Vladimir Medina. vice-president; Fleming McMurray . president ; Den­
ise Schroeder. secre tary-treasure r ; Ricardo D. Garza. public re lations . 
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FRONT ROW : Emerson Korges. sponsor ; Larry Barner. vice -chairman . ROW 2: Don 
Carden . secre ta ry; David G. Ford . chairman . 

IEEE 
The Institute of Electrical and 

Electronic Engineers (IEEE) is 
geared to increase understand­
ing of the field both for profes­
sionals and students . 

The 40-member club is open 
to any electrical engineering 
students or science majors. 

The club heard guests speak 
on holography and on automa­
tion of oil fields. 

Three senior projects were 
presented including Guy Farm­
er's and Shawn Bodine's electric 
car, Walter Byrne's and Terry 
White's digital display system 
and Robert Hunter's electronic 
tachometer. 

FRONT ROW: Marvin R. Redden. ROW 2: Keith Carpenter. Herman O . Weber. Harivadan Pate l . Guillermo Soria. Emerson 
Korges (advisor). ROW 3: Walte r Byrne. Don Herring. Roberto Garcia Jr.. Don Carden. Larry Barner. Reynaldo Trevino. David 
G . Ford. 
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FRONT ROW: Boonruang Suvannaram. Mayuree Trakultamupathum. Yiu Chin Yang . Sukanya Sinprasong. Chuan Chuan Chou. 
ROW 2: Euge ne Yu. Man Lee Wan. Nicholas E. Douglas. H. N. Bhatt. Amarshi D. Sanariya. Mahesh Shah. Rajendrakumar 
Surati. Nitin Shah . Dilip Patel. B. N. Avlani. Dinanath Gharmalker. Hossein Mahyar. ROW 3: Yuen Chi Chai . Festus Ileg­
bodu. Paris M. Lee. David O. Correia. Balakrishna. Amnvay Teerametee. Chavalit Kachornvanich. Hari Patel. Chanh Trung 
Nguyen. Jy- Ching Msong. 

International 
Students 

The International Students 
Club is one of the newer organi­
zations on the Texas A&I cam­
pus. 

Its purpose is to provide the 
meeting ground for foreign stu­
dents interested in international 
friendship. 

The only membership 
requirement of the club is to be 
a Texas A&I student. Currently 
there are 150 members. 

Collecting can goods for the 
needy at Thanksgiving was the 
group's biggest project. Town 
trips and picnics are also held. 

Bake sales and raffles were 
the club's fund-raising activi­
ties. 

FRONT ROW: Ahmed Ghariani. chairman; Mayuree Trakultamupathum. secretary ; 
Htin Win. president. ROW 2: Festus O. Ilegbodu. parliamentarian; Pratap Reddy. 
vice - president; Hari Patel. treasurer. 
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FRONT ROW : Abel A. Dominguez. historian; Tommy Tuggle. president; John 
Henry Rodriguez. parliamentarian; Richard R. Garcia. treasurer. ROW 2: Richard 
Garza. corresponding secretary; Robert Garza. vice-president; Mike Bryan. secre ­
tary; Dr. Joseph L. Bellamah. sponsor. 

Kappa Kappa 
Psi 

"Strive for the highest" is the 
motto for Kappa Kappa Psi band 
fraternity. 

The fraternity exists to pro­
mote the existence and welfare 
of the university band, to honor 
outstanding bandsmen through 
the privilege of membership. to 
foster a close relationship 
between college bands, and to 
provide a pleasant and helpful 
experience for all engaged in 
college band work. 

This chapter is the complete 
organizer of Band Day in the 
fall. It also runs the Southwest 
Texas Jazz Band Festival in the 
spring. 

FRONT RO W: Richard Garza. Raul H. Gonzalez . Abel A. Dominguez. Robert Garza. Carol Garza . Tommy Tuggle. John Henry 
Rodriguez. Jose Armando Garza. William A. Wheaton. Richard R. Garcia. ROW 2: Ricardo Ramirez. Perry Morris. Orlando 
Cipriano. Mike Bryant. Nehemiah Whitehead III. Darre l Gan. Charlie Munsell. Dr. Joseph L. Bellamah (sponsor). 
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FRONT ROW: Rosie Cruz. Nori Perez. Gloria Guerrero. Blanca A . Bocanegra . ROW 2: Marilyn Y. Sampley. Ph.D. (advisor). 
Jennifer Young. Mary Jo Oberg. Minnie Elizondo. Maria R. Guillen . ROW 3: Susie Wyatt. Fantina Trevino . Nelda Lamar 
Ibaniz. Linda Mapus. 

Kappa 
Omicron Phi 

"Prove all things. hold fast to 
that which is true and the truth 
will make you free" is the 
motto of Kappa Omicron Phi. 

The purpose of the society is 
to further the best interests of 
home economics by recognizing 
and encouraging scholastic 
excellence. developing leader­
ship abilities. fostering profes­
sional activities and interests. 
and promoting fellowship 
among staff and students of the 
profession. 

Members must be enrolled as 
a major or minor in home eco­
nomics with 60 or more hours. 
ha ve the prescribed G. P . A . 
points and show superior per­
sonal qualities and potentiali­
ties of leadership. 

FRONT ROW: Blanca A. Bocanegra. president; Susie Wyatt. vice-president. ROW 
2: Marilyn Y. Sampley. sponsor; Fantina Trevino. reporrer; Minnie Elizondo . sec ­
retary . 
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OFFICERS: Dr. James Herring. sponsor; Lilly Flores. publicity; Carlos Vela. presi­
dent; Dr. Hari Dam. sponsor; Leo Alarcon. vice-president. 

Media Society 
The Media Society is 

designed to promote profes­
sional interest in all aspects of 
mass communication and to 
establish rappon between work­
ing journalists and A&I student 
journalists. 

Membership is open to all 
journalism majors and minors, 
speech majors with the radio-tv 
sequence and any students who 
have had three hours of journal­
ism or equivalent professional 
experience. 

Among the club's fund raising 
projects were car washes, a 
flea-market at the Fall Carni­
val and a raffle . 

The money is used for the 
club's annual banquet. 

FRONT ROW : Sarah Turk. Estelle Hendrick. Lilly Flores. Anita Camarillo . ROW 2: Carlos Vela. Hari Dam (advisor). Norma 
Zamora. Noelia Rodriguez. ROW 3: Dr. James Herring (advisor). Laura Davila. Yvonne Kellough . Sylvia Barrera. Terri Acker­
man . David Flores. ROW 4: David Schnitz. Tom Daughters. Elizabeth Ransom. David Vasquez. Leo Alarcon. 
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FRONT ROW: Blanca Chapa. Cynthia Munguia. Sandra Rubio. Cynthia A. Hidalgo. Dwight Hazlett (advisor). ROW 2: Julie 
Harralson. Shirley Hammock. Janet Bernsen. Anna Lee Zamora. Julie Pinkenon. Irma Estela Palacios. ROW 3: Rosa Linda B. 
Garcia. Linda Cunningham. Dora Salinas. Patsy Kilbourn. 

Phi GammaNu 
Phi Gamma Nu sorority is 

geared to encourage scholarship 
and association of women stu­
dents who have the common 
goal of business. 

Membership is open to any 
business or business education 
(female) major with a mini­
mum of six hours of business and 
at least a 2.0 G.P.A. 

One of the activities spon­
sored by the club is the annual 
Easter Egg Hunt at Youth City. 
Pink Lady volunteer work for the 
Kingsville hospital is another 
club activity. 

Car washes, flower sales and 
raffles are used to raise money 
for rush functions and to support 
the chapter's adopted child, 

FRONT ROW: Blanca Chapa. advisor; Cynthia Munguia, ueasurer; Sandra Rubio. 
president; Dwight Hazlett. advisor. ROW 2: Rosa Linda B. Garcia. pledge captain; 
Julie Harralson. vice-president; Anna Lee Zamora. secretary; Irma Estela Palacios. 
editor. 
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FRONT ROW : John Henry Rodriguez. alumni secretary; Richard R. Garcia. presi­
dent; Eduardo Garcia. vice-president. ROW 2: Samuel Zapata. historian; Fe lix 
Cruz. warden; Jerry Salazar. recording secretary; Dan Duncan. advisor. 

PhiMu 
Alpha 

Phi Mu Alpha Sinfonia oper­
ates under the motto "Men in 
Music. " 

The purpose of the organiza­
tion is to encourage and 
actively promote the highest 
standards of creativity, per­
formance, education and 
research in music in America. 

Membership is open to males 
with a 2.25 G.P.A., member­
ship in a musical organization 
and who goes through a pledge­
ship. 

The na tional organization 
was founded in Boston, Massa­
chusetts in October 1898. 

Mr. Dan J. Duncan is the 
cha pter sponsor . 

FRONT ROW: John Henry Rodriguez. Richard Garcia. Eduardo Garcia. ROW 2: Felix Cruz. Jerry Salazar. Charles Cabrera Jr. 
ROW 3: Samuel Zapata. Dan Duncan. Jose Angel Soliz. Alex Sanchez. 
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cha pter sponsor . 

FRONT ROW: John Henry Rodriguez. Richard Garcia. Eduardo Garcia. ROW 2: Felix Cruz. Jerry Salazar. Charles Cabrera Jr. 
ROW 3: Samuel Zapata. Dan Duncan. Jose Angel Soliz. Alex Sanchez. 
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FORENSICS SQUAD: FRONT ROW: Gloria Allen. Laura Hubert. Pam Tuma. ROW 2: Randall J. Buchanan. Marin Perez Jr .• 
Clyde Barrow. ROW 3: Antonio Falcon Leal Jr .• Mike Blackwell. Gilbert Zepeda. 

Pi Kappa 
Delta 

"The art of persuasion, beau­
tiful and just" is the motto of 
the Pi Kappa Delta Honorary 
speech fraternity. 

The lO-member chapter 
strives to preserve the ethical 
ideals of persuasion on the 
intercollegiate level of forensic 
competition and to provide an 
incentive for achievement. 

Six rounds of forensic compe­
tition is required for member­
ship. 

One of the special projects of 
this group is to work with the 
forensic squad in judging at var­
ious elementary. junior high 
and high school speech tourna­
ments throughout South Texas 
including some UIL district 
tournaments. 

PI KAPPA DELTA: FRONT ROW: Marin Perez Jr . • president; Laura Hubert. secre­
tary-treasurer; Pam Tuma . ROW 2: Randall J. Buchanan. honorary member; Clyde 
Barrow. vice-president. ROW 3: Mike Blackwell. reporter-historian. 
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OFFICERS : Mary Ann Rivas. Reponer; Ramona Diaz. Vice-President; Jorge E. 
Guerra. President; Lamar Garcia. Secretary. 

Raza Unida 
The origin of the Raza Unida 

Club on this campus dates from 
1972 as an offshoot of the cam­
paign to elect Ramsey Muniz 
governor. The club was active 
in trying to raise votes. 

The purpose of the club now is 
to educate Chicano students of 
their cultural contributions to 
history. and to protect students 
in the area of equal opportunity 
and education. 

Among the club's guest 
speakers are Ramsey Muniz, 
Jose A. Gutierrez, founder of 
the Raza Unida Party of Texas; 
Lupe Youngblood, chairman of 
R. U. P. for Texas; and Carlos 
Guerra, speaker/writer of the 
Chicano movement in South 
Texas. 

FRONT ROW: Humberto Hernandez. Ramona Diaz. Juan Galvan. Lamar Garcia. Martha Silva. ROW 2: lv1ary Ann Rivas. Raul 
Villarreal. Magda Trevino. ROW 3: Dr. Jose Reyna. sponsor; Jorge E. Guerra . Rosemary Rivas. Mary Helen Rosales Vela. Juan 
Garza. Rene Ayala. Victor Facio. 
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FRONT ROW: Adan Acevedo. Dr. David Crenshaw (sponsor). Marvin 1. Nash. Daniel Garza. Michael Wiede. Leslie Friedrichs. 
Oscar Ramos. Encarnacion Garcia. Raul M. Hinojosa. ROW 2: Lin Becerra. Margaret Stockton. Steve Dollery. Kay Lynn 
Machen. Kathy Murray. Theresa Pooley. Patricia Phillipp. Lee Ann Kreuz. Sharon West. Lindy Smith. Ted Smith. Myrna 
Smith. Debi Dorow. Susan Martin. Jane Stevenson. Pattie Dallace. Susan Bourne. Michelle DeHart. Vicki Griffin. Oscar 
Esparza. ROW 3: Beth Jenkins. Lino Reauenez. Richard Brunner. Ronnie Dunkin. Cheryl Brite. J. Rodney Anderson. Karen 
Wheeler. Daniel R. Bubaker. Jimmy Rutledge. Bruce Menking. Silverio Perez. Denise Hoelscher. Larry Mokry. Shannon Mur­
phy. Michael Weaver. Julie De Koch . ROW 4: Dr . E. L. Sparks Jr. (advisor). Mary Scalise . Vicki Waters. Tom Groner. Kenneth 
Karnei. Cyndi Schultz. Lee Richardson. Len Norez. Dudly Power. John Goines. Keith Adams. Ken Griffin. Hans Hovda. Barry 
1. Paryzek. Judy Lynn Havelka. Mike Terrell. ROW 5: Butch Roeckev. Joe Jones . Robert Blade. David Acker. David R. Rami­
rez. Steve White. Artis Karnei. Robert Elliott. Apolonio Moranda Jr .• Gerald Mick. Herbert Power. Robert Rieder. Francis 
Moltz. Araceli Garza. David Garza. Greg Schreiber. Ray Meyer . 

Rodeo Club 
The Texas A&I Rodeo Club 

works toward promoting rodeo 
throughout the Texas A&I stu­
dent body and to support the 
campus rodeo team. 

The 75-member club is open 
to any student taking 12 or more 
hours. 

Each year a buckle is given 
for the high point team member 
and jackets are presented to 

team members who qualify. 
The club sponsors the Parents' 

Day Rodeo. one NIRA rodeo (to 
raise money to support the 
team) and the district high 
school rodeo finals. 

FRONT ROW: Cyndi Schultz. treasurer; Susan Bourne. reporter. ROW 2: Steve Dol­
lery. team member; Larry Mokry. vice-president and team member; Denise 
Hoelscher. secretary; Marvin L. Nash. parliamentarian and team member; Michael 
Wiede. president. ROW 3: Lin Becerra. team member; Dr. David Crenshaw. spon­
sor ; Robert Elliot. team member; Dr. E. 1. Sparks. sponsor. 
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FRONT ROW: Ida Marie Herrera. secre tary; Mae Dell Schiller. sponsor. ROW 2: 
Gloria Cantu Rivera. treasurer; Ruben M. Sanchez. president. 

Sigma Delta Pi 
Gamma Lambda Chapter of 

Sigma Delta Pi was organized in 
1952. 

The spanish honor society 
honors those who seek and attain 
excellence in the study of the 
Spanish language, literature 
and culture. 

It also fosters friendly rela­
tions and mutual respect 
between nations of Hispanic and 
English speech. 

Applicants for membership in 
the society must have com­
pleted a third level Spanish 
course, have a 3.0 average or 
better in Spanish and have an 
overall G.P.A. of: 2.5 if a 
sophomore, 2.6 if a junior and 
2.7 if a senior. 

FRONT ROW: Maria Deleon. Guadalupe Pe rez. Norma Ramirez. Eva Midobuche. ROW 2: Maria Elida Garcia. Rosalinda O. 
Hernandez. Queta Dovalina. Lupita G. Villarreal. Rosa Linda Garcia. Rosemary Rosales. ROW 3: Ramiro T. Moreno. Ruben M. 
Sanchez. Ida Marie Herrera. Eunice Perez. Gloria Cantu Rivera. Mae Dell Schiller (advisor). 
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FRONT ROW: Ida Marie Herrera. secretary; Mae Dell Schiller. sponsor. ROW 2: 
Gloria Cantu Rivera. treasurer; Ruben M. Sanchez. president . 
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FRONT ROW : Tim Hansfield . Fred Dissinger. ROW 2: Dale Lee . James Fealy. John Wheeler. ROW 3: Mike McFalls. H. B. 
Fisher . Phil Monroe. Paul Bingaman. 

Skin and 
Scuba 

The Texas A&I Skin and 
Scuba Diving Club boasted 25 
members this year. 

The club tries to awaken a 
wide and intelligent interest in 
skin and scuba diving and tries 
to acquire and disseminate 
accurate information concern­
ing this program. 

Promoting safe diving through 
education is one of its key 
aims. 

The club. which was started 
in the spring of 1975. has heard 
a speaker deal with the topic of 
new techniques in scuba diving 
and viewed films about such 
places as Barrier Reef. 

Numerous dive trips and a 
picnic on St. Joseph's Island are 
among its activities, 

OFFICERS: Dale Lee. president ; Phil Monroe . vice -president; Tim Hansfield . u ea­
surer. 
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FRONT ROW: Rev. Flores. vice-president; Hilda Gonzales. treasurer; Del Rhea 
King. president. ROW 2: Martin Castillo. reporter; C. G. Cadena. secretary; 
Joseph Domino. sponsor . 

Sociology 
Club 

The Texas A&I University 
Sociology Club works to stim­
ulate personal development. 
promote sociology and the 
study of sociology on this 
campus . 

Membership is open to any­
one currently taking or having 
taken three hours of sociol­
ogy. psychology. or anthro­
pology. 

The 3D-member club was 
organized in the fall of 1974 
and has built up increasingly 
both in interest and size. 

Various guest speakers cov­
ered such topics as Indian 
tribes in Mexico. planned 
parenthood. race relations. 
and the gay liberation. 

FRONT ROW: Hilda Gonzales, Rey Flores, Margie Lopez. George Zarate, Mary Cortez. Janie Salazar. Adelaida Buitrox. Cythia 
Ramsey. Patricia Vasquez. ROW 2: Jack Morse. Martin Castillo. Del Rhea King. Phyllis Arnold. Jor Zapata, Rene R. Barrera. 
Eusebio Torres. Margaret J. Anderson. C. C. Cadena. ROW 3: Joseph Domino (advisor). Bobby Burton. Tommy Lane Castilow. 
Israe l A. Cantu. Arnold C. Ramirez. Jose Luis Morales, Sharon Hurd. 
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FRONT ROW: Mary Sue Skloss. Rhonda Logue. Rita Hoelscher . Fufu Smith. Jenny Jonas. Patty Gonzalez. Anna Lozano. John 
Dela Rosa. He len Ogdee . Mary R. Garcia. Evelyn Huerta. ROW 2: Clyde Barrow. Bill Bronstad. John Daugherty. Alonzo 
Munoz. Henry Garcia. Mando Pena. Ray Ruiz. Ralph Escobar. ROW 3: Roy George. Scott Sampsell. John Pe tersen. Domingo 
Garcia. Pratap Reddy. David Joe l Garza. ROW 4: Jorge Guerra. Ramona Diaz. 

Student 
Association 

The Texas A&I Students Asso­
ciation serves to represent the 
student body and give them a 
voice with the administration. 

The organization is headed by 
a president and vice-president 
who are elected in the spring by 
the student body. Roy Valdez 
and John Dela Rosa held those 
positions this year. 

The secretary, parliamenta­
rian and speaker of the house 
are elected by the representa­
tives in the Congress. 

The representatives are 
elected according to places 
from each college determined 
by the enrollment in that col ­
lege (i. e. Arts and Sciences). 
Their election is held in the 
fall. 

FRONT ROW: Fufu Smith. Jr. vice-president; Jenny Jonas. Fr. representative . ROW 
2: Eve lyn Huerta. Fr. representative; John Daugherty. Soph . representative; John 
Dela Rosa. vice -president. RO W 3: Roy Valdez. president ; Ramona Diaz . Sr. rep­
resentative; Alonzo Munoz. Jr . representa tive . 
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FRONT ROW: JoAnn Blalock. assistant secretary-treasurer; Minnie Elizondo. vice­
president. ROW 2: Doris Gaines. historian ; Susie Gutierrez. secre tary- treasurer ; 
Nori Perez . president. 

Student 
Dietetics 

The Texas A&I Student Diet­
etics Association was started on 
campus two years ago. 

The purpose of the organiza­
tion is to provide a framework 
for meaningful student involve­
ment and to stimulate interest 
in the profession of dietetics. 

Chalupa sales and selling 
candied apples at the Fall Car­
nival are two of the club's fund­
raising projects. The money is 
used to support the club and pay 
for refreshments for the meet­
ings. 

Guest speakers usuall y 
include restaurant manage rs, 
cafeteria managers and hospital 
dieticians. 

FRONT ROW : Rosie Cruz. Nori Perez. Blanda A. Bocanegra. Leonora Martin. Patty Garcia. Minnie Elizondo . Maria R. Guillen. 
ROW 2: Ruth Gauldin. Ph.D . (advisor). Susie Gutierrez. Melissa Olmstead. Doris Gaines. Rosie Rodriguez. Lillian Saenz. Rose 
Mary Loera. ROW 3: Cindy Lopez . Fantina Trevino. Theresa Bluntzer. JoAnn Blalock . Ruth Gonzalez . Suzie Kollaja. Debbie 
Jenkins . 
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FRONT ROW: Luis Coronado. ROW 2: Rolando Bazan. Adela J. Munoz. ROW 3: Jose Antonio Franco. Moreno Re ynaldo. Juan A. 
Ga lvan . 

SUGB 
The eight-member Student 

Union Governing Board of Texas 
A&I University is composed of 
students elected in the spring to 
serve as sub-committee chair­
persons to bring events to the 
student population. 

Throughout the year films are 
brought to the campus primarily 
through this organization. 
These included .. Friends ... 
"The Devil's Wedding Night." 
"Phantom of the Paradise." 
.. Vanishing Point." .• Where 
Eagles Dare" and many more . 

Among the group's projects 
are the Fall Carnival. the stu­
dent activities calendar and the 
16th of September celebration. 

Pool. snooker and ping pong 
tournaments are also sponsored 
along with dances and concerts. OFFICERS : Adela J. Munoz. secre tary; Luis Coronado . chairman. 
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FRONT ROW: John Wheeler. cataloger. ROW 2: Dr. 1. Calusio. sponsor; Mike 
Jones. secretary. ROW 3: David G. Ford. vice-president; Stuart Franke. treasurer. 

Tau Beta Pi 
The Texas Lambda Chapter of 

the Tau Beta Pi association 
serves to distinguish those engi­
neering students who have 
brought honor to their alma 
mater by outstanding scholar­
ship and exemplary character. 
It also fosters a spirit of liberal 
culture in engineering colleges. 

There were 22 active mem­
bers in the club which held its 
annual barbecue during Engi­
neering week and dedicated it 
to Dr. Frank H. Dotterweich, 
retiring natural gas engineering 
professor. 

The club presents two schol­
arships annually to the top 
'reshman and sophomore engi­
neering students. 

FRONT ROW: Kenneth Rowland. Delilah Broca. Chuong Nguyen. Bill Tschoerner. Jesus Bello. ROW 2: Dr. J . Calusio (advisor). 
Mickel P. McKinney. Walter Byrne. Dr. K. C . Costerhollt. Don Herring. Mike Jones. Hari Patel. ROW 3: John Wheeler. Gus­
tavo Alvarado. Roberto Garcia Jr. • David G. Ford. Stuart Franke. Kenneth Riley. Alan McCulley. Mike Smith. 
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FRONT ROW: Mary Cruz. John Henry Rodriguez (beau). Onilia Basaldua. ROW 2: Sylvia Diaz. Dr. Joseph L. Bellamah 
(advisor). Cathy Williams. 

Tau Beta 
Sigma 

The Delta Eta Chapter of Tau 
Beta Sigma honorary sorority for 
women in the college band was 
organized on this campus in 
February of 1970. 

One of the purposes of this 
organization is to promote the 
existence and welfare of the 
collegiate bands and to create a 
respect and appreciation for 
band activities and achieve­
ments. 

Honoring outstanding women 
in the band through privilege of 
membership which is extended 
in recognition of musical 
achievement. demonstrated 
leadership and an enthusiastic 
approach to band activities is 
another purpose. 

Good attendance in band and 
a healthy attitude towards it is a 
requirement . 

OFFICERS: Cathy Williams. vice-president; Sylvia Diez. president. ROW 2': Onilia 
Basaldua. secretary ; Mary Cruz. treasurer. 
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a healthy attitude towards it is a 
requirement . 

OFFICERS: Cathy Williams. vice-president; Sylvia Diez. president. ROW 2': Onilia 
Basaldua. secretary; Mary Cruz. treasurer. 



Mike Blackwell. president and instructor. 

Tae-Kwon-Do 
The Texas A&I Tae-Kwon-Do 

Karate Club began in 1973 with 
the idea of teaching classical 
tae-kwon-do. Since then, it has 
evolved to emphasize more prac­
tical techniques and principles of 
Karate and self defense such as 
street fighting. 

· ·With power comes responsi­
bility" is the motto of the cur­
rently 15-member club. 

Membership is open to anyone 
with dedication, a desire to learn 
and $10 a month for dues. 

Tests are held every May, 
August and December to give 
each student an opportunity for 
advancement to the next rank. 

FRONT ROW: Mike Blackwell. Tom Basaldua. Gary Sharp. Jaime Mercado. Michael Cullen. John McKenzie . ROW 2: Willie 
Mitchell. Tina Espino. Victor Facio. 
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FRONT ROW : Dr . Salvador Alvarvz. Mrs. Maria Morales. Maria De Leon. Guadalupe Perez. Ana Laura Saenz. Ofelia Trevino. 
Eva Midohuche. Rosemary Rosales. Rosa L. Valdez . ROW 2: Maria E. Garcia. Mary C. J. Rodriguez. Maria E. Romero. Queta 
Dovalina. Rosa Linda Garcia. Norma Noie Benavides. Rosalinda Chavera. Ernestina Diaz Infante. Becky Peacock. ROW 3: Ali­
cia Elizondo. Rosalinda Hernandez . Leticia Martinez. Gloria Cantu Rivera. Mauro L. Pena Jr.. Ruben M. Sanchez. Saul Ber­
mea. Valentin Garza Jr. 

TASBE 
The Texas Association of Stu­

dents for Bilingual Education 
was officially approved in April 
of 1975 and carried with it the 
distinction of being the first 
college-level bilingual program 
to be established in the nation. 

As a result. bilingual clubs 
being formed around the nation 
are patterning themselves after 
the local 42-member club. 

The purpose of T ASBE is to 
promote and improve the qual­
ity. the procedures and the phi­
losophy of bilingual-bicultural 
education through the exchange 
of ideas and practices and 
through the distribution of liter­
ature. 

FRONT ROW: Guadalupe Perez. treasurer; Rosalinda O. Hernandez . vice-president; 
Rosa L. Valdez. president. ROW 2: Dr. Salvador Alvarez. co-sponsor; Mrs. Maria 
Morales. co-sponsor. ROW 3: Ruben M. Sanchez. historian; Mauro Pena Jr:. chair­
man; Gloria Cantu Rivera. executive secre tary. 
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As a result. bilingual clubs 
being formed around the nation 
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through the distribution of liter­
ature. 
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Rosa L. Valdez. president. ROW 2: Dr. Salvador Alvarez. co-sponsor; Mrs. Maria 
Morales. co-sponsor. ROW 3: Ruben M. Sanchez. historian; Mauro Pena Jr:. chair­
man; Gloria Cantu Rivera. executive secretary . 



FRONT ROW: Elena Murillo. secreta ry; Nestara Perez. historian; Diane Lee Soliz. 
president. ROW 2: Conchi Hernandez . reporter; Esther Soliz. treasurer; Norma 
Irene Pe rez . parliamentarian. ROW 3: Travis Polk . sponsor; Rodolfo R. Salazar. 
vice -president ; Ernest Herriman. sponsor. 

TSEA 
"Now is the Time" was the 

year's theme for the Texas Stu­
dent Education Association. 

The purposes of the club focus 
on preparing education students 
for the teaching profession and 
trying to raise the profession's 
standards. 

Membership is open to anyone 
interested in education and is a 
student member of the Texas 
State Teachers Association and 
National Education. 

The 116- member chapter has 
heard speakers covering such 
topics as hiring practices . Plan 
A. Bilingual Education. and 
professional rights and responsi­
bilities. 

Tutoring at Youth City is one 
of their projects. 

FRONT ROW : Nelda Soliz . Maria Teresa Hernandez . Elvira Perez . Elsa Canales . Lydia Ramos. Janie Anabe l Salazar. Diana 
Munoz . Ruby Valent. Gloria I. Garza. Nestara Perez . ROW 2: Elizabe th Rea. Con chi Hernandez . Elena Murillo. Sylvia A . 
Flores. Esthe r Soliz . Errlinda Castillo. Judith G. Adams . Silvana Garcia. Armandina Garza . Diana Lee Soliz. ROW 3: Dr. Ernest 
Herriman . Rodolfo R. Salazar. Rosalinda O . Hernandez. Osvaldo Hernandez Jr.. Rosalinda Lopez. Norma Irene Perez. !;ocorro 
Fraga. Mauro L. Pena Jr.. Yolando Colin. Jesse Mendoza. Ernesto Hernandez. Travis Polk. 
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A. Bilingual Education, and 
professional rights and responsi­
bilities. 

Tutoring at Youth City is one 
of their projects. 

FRONT ROW: Nelda Soliz. Maria Teresa Hernandez. Elvira Perez. Elsa Canales. Lydia Ramos. Janie Anabel Salazar. Diana 
Munoz. Ruby Valent. Gloria I. Garza. Nestara Perez. ROW 2: Elizabeth Rea. Con chi Hernandez. Elena Murillo. Sylvia A. 
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FRONT ROW : Maria J. Castanon . Velma DeLa Cruz . Connie Rodriquez . Maria Elena Silva. Teresa Gonzalez. Rache l Ramirez. 
L. Elizabeth Davila. Claudia Estella Rodriquez . Evelyn Huerta. Pa tricia Gonzalez . Roel Villarreal (sponsor) . ROW 2: Jerry 
Jackson. Fre d Cedillo. Irene Gonzalez . Pearlie Vasquez. Cynthia A. Rodriquez . Edna Leal. Frances N. Herre ra. Laura Rayes. 
Marie Pe na. Silda Se rna. Evelia Villarreal. Tereza Gonzalez . Ismae l He rnandez . Alonzo Perez. ROW 3: Rudy Torres . Estela 
Ve la. Humbelina More no. Rosie Salazar. Alma Pena. Mary R. Garcia. Maria Be navides. Imelda Tristan. Jose Arevalo 
Orlando. Ruben Garcia. Fermin Garza. Larry Gutierrez. Alberto Martine z . Ruben Molina. 

Upward 
Bound Alumni 

"Upward bound . . . Natu­
rally" is the motto for the 
Texas A&I Upward Bound 
Alumni Association. 

It is a social organization 
with only one membership 
requirement, $10 dues per year . 

The group has sponsored 
Thursda y night beer busts at 
Crimson Palace, a booth in the 
Fall Carnival, sold candied 
apples and had car washes to 
raise money for their emer­
gency fund. It is used for schol­
arship funds and group activi­
ties. 

One of the group's projects 
was to take some nursery and 
pre-school aged children on a 
safe Halloween trick-or-treat­
ing trip through the dorms and 
the president' shouse. 

FRONT ROW : Ne lda Moya. treasurer; Tereza Gonzalez. vice -president; Cynthia 
Ann Rodriguez . corresponding secretary; Evelyn Hue rta. secretary. ROW 2: Lydia 
Zavala. president; Jerry Jackson. sponsor; Ismael Hernandez. sergeant- at-arms. 
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FRONT ROW: Hilda Martinez. historian; Janie M. Facundo. vice-president. ROW 
2: Anna St. Leger. secretary-treasurer; Yvonne Hacker. president; Jane Meredith. 
sponsor. 

WRA 
The Women' s Recreation 

Association strives to promote 
the advancement of physical 
education through the inte­
grated ideas of all female stu­
dents regardless of their major. 

The group was spoken to 

about and shown a demonstra­
tion of Aerobic Dancing. 

The group also made a trip to 

Youth City where they provided 
the children there with various 
forms of recreation including 
softball, football and jump 
rope. 

A basketball clinic and a vol­
leyball clinic were both spon­
sored by the group to raise 
money for awards, picnics and 
banquets. 

FRONT ROW: Hilda Martinez. Lydia Hernandez. Kathy Abundo. Zaida F. Gonzales. Janie M. Facundo. ROW 2: Sylvia Arguijo. 
Anna St. Leger. Delma Elizondo. Maria Elena Shears. Conchi Hernandez. Jane Meredith (sponsor). ROW 3: Joretta Howard. 
Yvonne Hacker. Martha B. Villarreal. Judith G. Adams. Yolanda Colin. Raylene Prukop. Cindy Williamson. Cindy Nanny. 
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ROW 1: Michael Allen. Bill Bronstad. John Habeeb. Bryan Dudman. Darell Perkins. Mike Dougherty. Mark Pester. ROW 2: Robert Bodet. 
Mark Bolus. Lyman Young. David Zeller. Danny Kuhn. 
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ROW 1: Susie Wyatt. Janet Bowers. Lisa McDavid. Marci Murff. ROW 2: Carol Lange. Lisa Wright. Nan Lavender. Theresa Pooley . 
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ALPHA CHI OMEGA 

1 . Jennifer Koehler 
2 . Nancy Kastner 
3 . San Juanita Romos 
4 . Bonnie Booker 
5 . Susie Wyatt 
6. Carol Lange 
7. Susie Rogers 
8. Chery 1 Walker 
9. Ann Strickler 

10. Evie Graham 
11. Pat Storino 
12. Debby Brown 
13. Judy Mechler 
14. Terry Cornelius 
15 . Rhonda Montgomery 
16 . Margaret Clear 

AXQ 
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ALPHA DELTA PI 

1. Linda Elter 
2. Glady 's Ne mec 
3 . Kim Pitchford 
4. Theresa Pooley 
5 . Laura Hubert 
6. Dana Cooper 
7. Carla Langley 
8. Jane t Wood 
9. Denise Hubert 

10. Laura Je rnigan 
11 . Cynthia McCloud 
12 . Karen Nie lsin 
13 . Ke itha Patte rson 
14 . Susan Hollon 
15. Penny Nichols 
16. De bbie Simmons 
17. Be tte Zinsmeyer 
18. Tricia Smith 
19. Cindy Dennis 
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ALPHA GAMMA 
RHO 

1. Mark Hansen 
2 . Mark Sugarek 
3. Kenneth Schuefer 
4. Jerry Lewis 
5 . Bill Tillman 
6 . Jimmy Ross 
7. Mrs. Mildred Haynes 
8 . Paul Lee Casares 
9. Dr. David Crenshaw 

10. Andy Prukop 
11 . Frank Stewart 
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ALPHA KAPPA 
ALPHA 

1. Denise Green 
2 . Alma Hall 
3. Marilyn Ruff 
4. Mary Proby 
5 . Yvonne Kellough 
6. Karen Elliott 
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ALPHA TAU OMEGA 

1. Blake Stasney 
2 . Jim Pruett 

31 . Shannon Murphy 
32 . Mary R. Robinson 

3 . Julio Morales 33. Karen Je tton 
4 . Paul Watson 34. Kathy Moore 
5. Jimmy Thompson 
6. Bob Reed 

35 . Cindy Harlan 
36. Juli Dekoch 

7. Jim Miller 37. Cheryl Dear 
8 . Martin Fisher 38. Betty Vredevelt 
9. Cary Jones 

10. David Smith 
39. Susan Wright 
40. Elizabe th Truitt 

11. Ronald Souder 41. Sharon Coins 
12. Cookie Caballero 42 . Robert Mercer 
13. Mary Sue Skloss 43 . Joanne Burrows 
14. Ruth Ann Welch 44 . Bryan Dudman 
15. Beverly Hennessee 
16. Judy Chambliss 
17 . Karen Reese 

45 . Jerry Haunschild 
46. Mike Harvey 
47. Ken Kimes 

18. Sharie Smith 48. David Corley 
19 . Debie Dorow 49. David Cunningham 
20. Debbie Tyrrell 50. Jimmy Stockton 
21. Donna Kahla 51. Jim Myers 
22. Mary Kate Korges 
23. Susan Wyatt 

52. Randy Pratt 
53. Harry Ullom 

24. Carol Bishop 54 . Tom Tyrre ll 
25 . Karen Parker 55 . Steve Barton 
26 . Roxy Flores 
27 . Barbara Goodpasture 

56. Steve Barton 
57. Buddy Womack 

28 . Becky Porucznik 
29 . Mary Ann McCormick 

58. Darre ll Perkins 
59. Jim Sedwick 

30 . Leslie Friedrichs 
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CHI OMEGA 

1. Jenny Jonas 
2 . Carol Bishop 
3 . Liz Truitt 
4. Mary Sue Skloss 
5. Rhonda Logue 
6. Kathy Moore 
7. Kathy Kellett 
8. Mary Ann McCormick 
9. Sally Miller 

10 . Nanci Sailor 
11. Lisa McDavid 
12. Eileen McCormack 
13 . Susan Brand 
14. Nan Lavender 
15. Fufu Smith 
16. Wanda Howard 
17. Leslie Pearson 
18 . Dina Kekey 
19. Barbara Good paster 
20. Karen Reese 
21. Cindy Harlan 
22. Dina Morrison 
23 . Ellen Kelly 
24 . Ruth Ann Welch 
25. Joretta Howard 
26. Debby Jirasek 
27. Debbie Canales 
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DELTA SIGMA PI 

1. Billy Sexton 
2 . Roy George 
3. Regina Walkley 
4. Alan Parks 
5 . Paul Mladenka 
6 . Mario Martinez 
7. Je rry Coufa l 
8 . Hank Sheeran 
9 . Steve Harry 

10. Douglas Pa lzer 
11. Louis Wallner 
12 . Ed O'Donne ll 
13. Dr . Gary French 

226 

DELTA SIGMA PI 

1. Billy Sexton 
2 . Roy George 
3 . Regina Walkley 
4. Alan Parks 
5 . Paul Mladenka 
6 . Mario Martinez 
7. Je rry Coufal 
8 . Hank Sheeran 
9. Steve Harry 

10 . Douglas Pa lzer 
11. Louis Wallner 
12 . Ed O· Donnell 
13. Dr. Gary French 

226 



~-

227 

~-

227 



228 

DELTA SIGMA 
THETA 

1. Glenda Dyer 
2. Danita Allen 
3 . Terria Frazier 
4. Mae Lance 
5. Charlotte Tolson 
6. Jocelyn Gage 
7 . Harriet Jackson 
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DELT A TAU DELTA 

1. Debbie Brown 24. Mark Hoover 
2. Rodney Popejoy 
3. Barbara Mueller 

25. Pat Storino 
26. Dallas Prince 

4. Eddie Herbst 27. Sheila Price 
5. Buddie Gunter 28 . David Zeller 
6. Vivian Armstrong 29 . Don Ferris 
7. Cheryl Walker 
8. Jere l Ponton 

30. Tony Hammac 
31. Jo Jo Mueller 

9. Becky McKee 
10. Danny Kuhn 
11 . Carol Lange 
12. Bill Canon 

32 . Larry Peterson 
33 . Terry Cornelius 
34 . Bonnie Booker 
35. Mike Dougherty 

13 . John McIver 36. Mark Martin 
14. Jo Elle n Glover 37 . Barbara Nance 
15. San Juanita Ramos 38. Cythia McCloud 
16. Robbie Quevillion 39. Cir.dy Nanny 
17. Jo Beth Darrington 
18. Rodney Johnson 
19. Bill Augustine 
20. Dee Dee Cade 

40. John Poole 
41. Dane Brink 
42 . Tommy Myers 
43. Reese Mitchell 

21. Jimmy Couch 
22 . George Jones 

44. James Batte rs 
45 . Buddy Darrington 

23 . David Merritt 
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KAPPA ALPHA PSI 

1. Carl Bibbs 
2. Deborah Taylor 
3. Charles Washington 
4. Belinda Ann Dawkins 
5. Lorna Gal Williams 
6 . Yvonne Kellough 
7. Meridth Jordan 
8. Mary Proby 
9. Terria Frazier 

10. Fred White 
11. Joe Smith 
12. Carol Mercer 
13. Ray Paschall 
14. Sandra Polk 
15. Cynthia Washington 
16. Charline Kearney 
17. Margaret Yancey 
18. Teresa Ingram 
19. Faulstine Wrigr 
20 . Ellis Thia pen 
21. Jeanette Crawford 
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KAPPA SIGMA 

1. Julie Yaklin 
2. Kim Barnhart 
3. Richard Unterbrink 
4. Evie Graham 
5. Mark Barnhart 
6. Huey Mothershed 
7. Jay Langdon 
8. Karla Hall 
9. Joe Bentley 

10. Cindy Balsl y 
11. Timmy Quillin 
12. Brian Bentley 
13. Mike Allen 
14 . Marie Huff 
15 . Sherry Bennett 
16. Bruce Kraatz 
17 . Del win McCain 
18. Jim Mills 
19. Jimmy Gilstrap 
20 . David Schnitz 
21. Mark Huff 
22 . Vickie Griffin 
23. Jim Maddox 
24. Jody McSloy 
25. Marty Smith 
26. Tom Best 
27. Robert Henderson 
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LAMBDA CHI 
ALPHA 

1 . Bill Bronstad 
2 . Marianne Fegan 
3 . Scott Sampsell 
4. Karen Walters 
5. Lesley Ridd le 
6 . Joe Lindeman 
7. Brenda Wildeman 
8. Brenda Suatton 
9 . Diane Coaling 

10. Mark May 
11 . Bruce Calloway 
12 . David Brown 
13 . Tom Cody 
14. Judy Melcher 
15. Jimmy Dyen 
16 . Kenny Jacobsen 
17. Larry Tschirhart 
18. Debbie Tucker 
19 . Donna Bogkin 
20 . Terry Lusby 

21. Dave Shetler 
22 . Lynn Carillo 
23 . 
24 . Scott Baldwin 
25 . Kathy Cook 
26 . Paul Heckman 
27 . Bob Bodet 
28 . Beverly O'Neal 
29 . Judy Garza 
30 . Butch Cohn 
31. Shanon Oem 
32 . Suzan Johnson 
33 . Joe Pina 
34 . Jon Morris 
35 . Cindy Black 
36 . Billy Drawe 
37. Jennife Koehler 
38 . Boyd Chessman 
39 . Cindy Brutton 
40 . Mark Pester 
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PHI KAPPA THETA 

1. Janie Garcia 
2 . Nena Cantu 
3. Ester -Zamora 
4. Helen Ochoa 
5. Esmey Garcia 
6 . Anna Cuellar 
7. Ovidio Garcia 
8. Richard Garcia 
9. Edward Orta 

10. Gracie Martinez 
11. Cynthia Quintanilla 
12. Liza Flores 
13. Aurora Rodriguez 
14 . Noemi Benavides 
15. Yolanda Espinosa 
16. Manuel Parras 
17. Jesus Flores 
18 . Del Carrillo 
19 . Carlos Hinojosa 
20. Johnny Alaniz 
21. Domingo Chapa 
22. Ram Molina 
23. Jake Sheeron 
24. Frank Rios 
25 . Bobby Mancias 
26 . Rene Garcia 
27. Avelino Jasso 
28. Oscar Flores 
29. Javier Ruiz 
30. Pete Molina 
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SIGMA CHI 

1. Raymond Gallagher 
2 . John Habeeb 

29. James R. Mcintyre 
30 . Richard Ritchie 

3 . Dina Kelley 
4. Greg Osborne 

31. Mike O'Shea 
32 . Martha Miller 

5. Mary Heard 
6. Kay Kieschnick 
7. Debbie Canales 
8. Patricia Smith 

33 . Jim Reed 
34. Rick Nemic 
35. Paul Riley 
36. Sue Coleman 

9. Laura Je rnigan 37 . Kie tha Patterson 
10. Dana Cooper 
11. Casey Wood 
12 . Liz Johnston 
13. Wanda Howard 
14. Sherie Carson 
15 . Connie Benton 
16. Kim Evans 

38. Stewart Dornburg 
39 . Mike Higgens 
40. David Hooper 
41. Steve Kineteg 
42. Allan Jurica 
43. Mark Hamilton 
44. Darre l Hazte r 

17. Jane t Bowers 
18. Alice Patillo 
19. John Gillis 
20. Steve Bosworth 

45. Clark Tatum 
46. Preston Livingston 
47. Jake Backman 
48. Mark Evans 

21. Nan Lavander 
22. Bob Reuther 
23. Pam Frey 

49. Mike Jeckel 
50. Joe Henke 
51. Mike Kridler 

24 . Cindy Dennis 
25. Kim Pitchford 
26. Betty Threadgill 
27 . Debbie Simmons 
28 . Betty Zinsmeyer 

52. Brent Whitehead 
53. Jeff Wright 
54. Bill Aldrich 
55. Mike Lowrey .. 
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TAU KAPPA 
EPSILON 

1. Doug Roth 
2. Garcia Nemesio 
3. Len Wilkerson 
4. Dave Stuart 
5. Eneida Gutierrez 
6 . Aurora Lopez 
7. Rosemary Ambriz 
8. Betti Tamayo 
9. Eddie Villarreal 

10. Robert Williams 
11. Martin Cuellar 
12. Robert Collins 
13. Curly Mimms 
14. Julio Garcia 
15. Bill Poole 
16. Ernest Rodriguez 
17. Jacob Renteria 
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ZETA TAU ALPHA 

1. Kay Kiechnick 
2 . Liz Johnston 
3 . Connie Beman 
4 . Cindy Prinz 
5. Robbie Crosnoe 
6. Julie Yaklin 
7 . Glenda Hees 
8. Sherry Carson 
9. Miche lle Bradshaw 

10. Sharon Cons 
11. Jane t Bowers 
12 . Dee Dee Cade 
13. Betty Threadgill 
14. Julie Danie ls 
15. Judy Vittitoe 
16. Glenda Ryan 
17. Leslie Friedriches 
18. Donna Kahla 
19 . Lisa Wright 
20. Ka thy Kirkpatrick 
21. Pam Harris 
22 . Laine Motheral 
23. Manha Mille r 
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Bryan C. Adam 
Marjorie Alexander 
Gloria Jean Allen 
Anna Maria Barrera 
Bonnie A. Benson 

Alfred Best 
Rita Marie Bockholt 
Donald Boson 
Deanne L. Bridges 
Allen Dale Bues 

Rebecca C. Cabrera 
Lesuia Cadena 
Julian D. Canizales 
Irma R. Cantu 
Maria Elena Cantu 

Maria Estella Cantu 
Virginia Marie Cantu 
Marie Elizabeth Carlson 
Mary Abigail Cavazos 
Amador Chapa, Jr. 

Carla Diane Chapa 
Margaret Rose Clear 
Carolyn Marie Cole 
Roger Merle Cole 
Kathryn Lynell Conlee 

Velma Elizabeth Corpus 
Muriel J. Crawford 
Mauricio Cruz, Jr. 
Anna Marie Cuellar 
Leticia Elizabeth Davila 

Susie E. Davila 
Belinda Ann Dawkins 
Cheryl Elizabeth Dear 
Michael D. Debner 
Da vid Del Bosque 

Velma De La Cruz 
Maria De La Benavides 
Oralia I De La Fuente 
Michelle Lee Dehart 
Linda Susana Dominguez 
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Nicholas Douglas 
Hal Hugh Dryden 
Joan Garol Edwards 
Rosario Elizondo 
Yvonne Denise Ellis 

George Allen Erchinger 
Belinda G. Escobar 
Steele Alexander Ewing 
Victor M. Facio 
Belinda Farmer 

Gene Arthur Felder 
Sandra L. Fernandez 
Harry E. Fields 
Loretta Figirova 
Martin Benson Fisher 

Griselda Flores 
Fred G. Flores 
Hilda P. Flores 
Rose Marie V. Flores 
Sylvia G. Flores 

Sharon Annette Flynn 
Gary Phillip Foster 
Michael Edward Fielding 
Bertha Fuentes 
Felix G. Garcia 

Juanita Patricia Garcia 
Maria Del Refugio Garcia 
Maria Rosario Garcia 
Michael A. Garcia 
Ruben Garcia 

Samuel Garcia 
San Juanita Garcia 
Annabel Garza 
Elvia Vela Garza 
Fermin Garza 

Irma Garza 
Maria Yvonne Garza 
Noemi Garza 
Noemi Elia Garza 
Eloy Gloria 
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Jaime Gomez, Jr. 
Cynthia Ann Gonzales 
Jaime Flores Gonzalez 
Christina M. Gonzalez 
Sylvia Gonzalez 

Brenda Louise Green 
Carlol yn Ann Griffin 
Kenneth Wayne Griffin 
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Lennis Edwin Jones 
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Charlene Kearney 
Joe Mac Keener 
Jonathan Kelley 
Tommy Sanford Kelly 
Cathy Jo Kesler 

Kathleen E. Koletar 
George Robert Kuehne, Jr. 
Jane Lyon Kuntscher 
Thelma Leal 
Mary Barbara Leon 
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Dalia Maldorado Longoria 
Bruno G. Lozano 
Garland Lee Luedecke 
Laura Belle Lusk 
Teresa Yvonne Lusby 

Rodolfo Mack 
Dyanne Martinez 
Joe Edward Martinez, Jr. 
Raul G. Martinez 
Mary Ann McCormick 

Natalie R. McKinney 
Candy Kayne McPherson 
Anna Laura Mendoza 
Mark David Meyer 
Marta Rita Mirelez 

Ruben M. Molina 
Anna Myrna Montoya 
Brenda Sue Moore 
RoseMary Moreno 

Laine Motheral 
David Edwin Mundine 
Criselda Munguia 
Maria Luisa Munoz 
Kathryn Jean Murray 

Elizabeth Kay Nava 
Jesus Navarro 
Pamela Ann Neyland 
Kathy Lynn Nowakowski 
Enedelia Obregon 

Dora Linda Ochoa 
Helen Jeanette Ogdee 
Oscar Bustos Olivarez 
Gwendolyn Park 
Eligio Pena 

Erasmo L. Pena 
Carlos Augustin Pereda 
Alonzo Perez 
Arabella Perez 
Ofelia Perez 

251 

Dalia Maldorado Longoria 
Bruno G. Lozano 
Garland Lee Luedecke 
Laura Belle Lusk 
Teresa Yvonne Lusby 

Rodolfo Mack 
Dyanne Martinez 
Joe Edward Martinez, Jr. 
Raul G. Martinez 
Mary Ann McCormick 

Natalie R. McKinney 
Candy Kayne McPherson 
Anna Laura Mendoza 
Mark David Meyer 
Marta Rita Mirelez 

Ruben M. Molina 
Anna Myrna Montoya 
Brenda Sue Moore 
RoseMary Moreno 

Laine Motheral 
David Edwin Mundine 
Criselda Munguia 
Maria Luisa Munoz 
Kathryn Jean Murray 

Elizabeth Kay Nava 
Jesus Navarro 
Pamela Ann Neyland 
Kathy Lynn Nowakowski 
Enedelia Obregon 

Dora Linda Ochoa 
Helen Jeanette Ogdee 
Oscar Bustos Olivarez 
Gwendolyn Park 
Eligio Pena 

Erasmo L. Pena 
Carlos Augustin Pereda 
Alonzo Perez 
Arabella Perez 
Ofelia Perez 

251 



252 

Maria Glenda Perez 
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Roy Lee Williams 
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Ralph C. Alexander, III 
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